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ABSTRACT 

 

The use of ukulele in school setting is becoming popular and its integration 

during classes is increasing in popularity. Because of this, it is significant 

and timely that this type of music be involved among learners of all ages. 

The consideration of providing support for mental and psychosocial well-

being among the students during the past pandemic was deemed neces-

sary. In this innovative work plan study, experimental-purposive approach 

was used in implementing the program. Integrating music in classes in-

creases primary students' class involvement and engagement in school ac-

tivities. Thus, the researcher introduced the Ukulele lesson to the Grade 3 

pupils and tried to look into the effect of its integration to the pupils’ psy-

chosocial development and academic performance. The participants were 

thirty-eight pupils (38) and eleven (11) MAPEH teachers for the school 

year 2022-2023 enrolled in an Integrated School in Pangasinan. The re-

sults revealed that there is an increase in the level of academic perfor-

mance of the Grade 3 pupils who were exposed to ukulele lessons as an 

intervention program focusing on psychosocial support. The elementary 

teachers were also able to maintain classroom cohesiveness and increased 

pupils’ class participation. The noise from unnecessary talking and shout-

ing or even playing inside the classroom were minimized.  This is one proof 

that music is a great stress-relieving tool that helps to calm the mind and 

enhance concentration among pupils and teachers. 
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Introduction 
The consideration of providing support for 

mental and psychosocial well-being among the 
students during the outbreak was deemed  
necessary since it was stated in Republic Act 
No. 11036, which is about the “Act in  
Establishing a National Mental Health Policy”. 

For the purpose of enhancing the delivery of in-
tegrated mental health services, promoting and 
protecting the rights of persons utilizing psy-
chosocial health services, that the state com-
mits itself to promoting the well-being of  
people by ensuring that; mental health is val-
ued, promoted and protected; mental health 
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conditions are treated and prevented; timely, 
affordable, high quality, and culturally-appro-
priate mental health case is made available to 
the public; mental health service are free from 
coercion and accountable to the service users; 
and persons affected by mental health condi-
tions are able to exercise the full range of hu-
man rights, and participate fully in society and 
at work free from stigmatization and discrimi-
nation (Mental Health Act, 2018).  

The Department of Education (2021) con-
tinues to extend assistance amid the situation 
to its personnel nationwide who were able to 
learn more about Mental Health and Psychoso-
cial Support Services (MHPSS) and Psychologi-
cal First Aid (PFA). The online-held event at-
tended by Regional and Division DRRM Coordi-
nators and School Health and Nutrition Person-
nel highlighted the importance of empathy and 
providing emotional support in these trying 
times where uncertainties may undermine a 
person’s mental health. 

Children will observe adults’ behaviours 
and emotions for cues on how to manage their 
own emotions during difficult times, which 
makes it more difficult if one teacher happened 
to be mentally and emotionally unready to han-
dle difficult situation. Stress and the feelings as-
sociated with it are by no means a reflection 
that a learner cannot do his or her task at 
school at once and that they might be emotion-
ally weak. Managing the mental health and psy-
chosocial well-being during this time is as im-
portant as managing the learners’ physical 
health (Bonsaksen et al., 2022). 

In view of this, the researcher used nature 
of a person has, which is the love for music. This 
is evident to all musically inclined programs 
over the televisions, radio and social media net-
works, in which to some, it showcases the tal-
ents of Filipinos either in vocals and in music 
instrument playing in the country and all over 
the world. 

The increasing importance given to music 
education was reflected in the passage of RA 
4723 (Music Law). Enacted in 1966, the Music 
Law was the first Legislative Act in the history 
of the country to directly benefit school music 
education. The law envisioned the upgrading of 
Philippine Musical Culture through the im-

provement of Music instruction on the elemen-
tary and secondary school levels of both public 
and private schools. 

Department Order # 1 s. 1957 observed 
that “music has for some years not been seri-
ously taught”. Prescribed in this bulletin was to 
combine Music to Art and Physical Education 
wherein Music seemed to have been scrapped 
from the daily schedule of subjects. General 
Letter #23, dated July 21, 1956 gave specific in-
structions that music should have a definite pe-
riod of time on the day’s program. The setback 
of the Music Course offerings was and still is the 
absence of instruments in the school. 

Thus, through the content and procedures 
of the Department of Education through the K 
to 12 program, musical instrument like the 
ukulele was integrated for the purpose of eval-
uating the effects of integration of musical in-
struments as school program; study the effect 
of musical instruments to the psychological de-
velopment of pupils; study focusing on musical 
instrument particularly ukulele; and identify 
the performance of the pupils with musical in-
strument particularly in ukulele. 

The COVID-19 brought an unforeseen men-
tal health crisis in its wake. In response to this, 
the World Health Organization (WHO) pub-
lished a guideline as a way of supporting men-
tal health and psychosocial well-being of differ-
ent groups of individuals during the pandemic. 
The drastic impact of the pandemic on mental 
health has pushed governments in many coun-
tries to put measures in place to curb not only 
the physical health of its citizens but also their 
mental health, emotional health and psychoso-
cial well-being as well (Molebatsi, et al., 2021).  

Lleogo (2022) stated that ever since lock-
down was imposed and social distancing was 
implemented, the students' traditional learning 
was halted. The Philippine Basic Education has 
been heavily affected by the COVID-19 pan-
demic as schools either public or private, in-
cluding several learning centres are closed for 
the physical conduct of classes due to the 
spread of transmission of the COVID-19. The 
critical response in protection of the stakehold-
ers of education is the provision of Mental 
Health and Psychosocial Support (MHPSS). 
This provision aims to help the students as well 
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as teachers to cope with the situation and de-
velop mental resilience. This initiative and pro-
vision of MHPSS is also included as a require-
ment of Health Standards in Basic Education 
Offices and Schools (DO 14, s. 2020).  

According to the World Health Organiza-
tion (2020) for those who care for children, 
they should offer assistance to children to dis-
cover positive ways to precise sentiments such 
as fear and pity. Each child has his or her way 
of communicating their own feelings and emo-
tions. Sometimes, engaging in a creative activ-
ity such as playing, drawing, dancing and sing-
ing can facilitate this process. The baggage that 
the children carry will be relieved if they can 
express and communicate their feelings and 
emotions in a safe, secure, and supportive envi-
ronment.  
 
Music for Academic Learning 

There is an abundance of studies focusing 
on various music-centered approaches to aid in 
the comprehension of subject matter in the cur-
ricular areas of language arts, social studies, 
mathematics and science. Dyer (2011) is also 
one of the major researchers to use music-
based activities to further literacy skills. In his 
study, Dyer suggests that incorporating music 
in classes increases primary students' class 
participation and engagement in school activi-
ties. Music also helps with memory and recall 
as well as in enhancing phonemic awareness 
during literacy instructions.  

Feinstein (2006) stated that the human 
brain is built for sound, as the sense of hearing 
being the first one to develop in the womb, cre-
ating brain intricate structures for sound pro-
cessing. Music and oral language are intercon-
nected, and the human brain makes use of the 
same structures to process and interpret music 
and language. Smith and Secoy (2019), ex-
plained the concept of using music activities as 
an alternative way to reduce habituation in the 
classroom. As defined, habituation is the pro-
cess of gradually tunning out of repeated 
sound, just like an educator's teaching voice. 
Using music and various sounds in the  
classroom can decrease the habituation effect, 
increase students' brain activity and ensure 
that the teacher is being heard by the students.  

 

Use of Music for Classroom Cohesiveness 
The most natural way of bringing people to-

gether is through music, as it is often referred 
to as the universal language that connects peo-
ple regardless of their backgrounds or beliefs. 
The same can be applied for music in an ele-
mentary school setting. As much as music im-
proves learning, helps create a conductive 
learning environment, and inspires creativity. 
Music can also serve as a strong hold and main-
tain cohesiveness in a classroom. Generally 
speaking, any school activities that fosters stu-
dent engagement is going to produce a positive 
effect on both behaviour issues and cohesive-
ness within the classroom. Those students who 
are distracted during discussions or those who 
are uninterested are the ones who typically are 
the stimulus to problems. With this regard, 
teachers need to keep them interested, out of 
trouble and make the whole class well man-
aged.  

Doebler (2021) mentioned that students 
who collaboratively work to composed their 
own song that they can use at the beginning or 
even at the end of their class maintain class-
room cohesiveness. He also claimed that stu-
dents who prefer to work in small groups to 
create or write their own song that express 
their emotion is a great idea to increase chil-
dren's engagement in class. Making use of cer-
tain instruments, putting the songs together on 
a recording or even making videos out to fit in-
creases students' creativity. Students who par-
ticipate in music activities and their learning 
capabilities in music are highly influenced by 
societal trends and their environment (Giebel-
hausen, 2016).  

One such trend in incorporating music in 
general is the use of ukulele in classrooms. 
Though the ukulele has been popular since 
then, Kruse (2013) believes that the world is 
experiencing a phenomenon called ukulele re-
naissance. Due to the revival of the ukulele's 
popularity, utilization of ukulele and its imple-
mentation has increased in classroom settings 
(Giebelhausen & Kruse, 2018). Thibeault and 
Evoy (2011), proposed that ukulele play along 
events and online training resources allow for 
a variety of opportunities for individuals, spe-
cifically learners, to create and share their mu-
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sic. They accentuated the value of these train-
ing resources and advocated that such training 
resources should support participants just like 
students in actively creating music using uku-
lele. 
 
Ukulele for Pupils and Teachers 

Same as in community music contexts, uti-
lization of ukulele has increased in school mu-
sic context as well. Although majority of the 
practitioner-based articles have recently 
grown in number for music educators who in-
corporate ukulele lessons in their classes (Ber-
nard & Cayari, 2020; Giebelhausen, 2016;) re-
search solely focused on the use of ukulele in 
music classrooms is relatively few and consid-
erably dated. Moreover, researchers who did 
include the ukulele have used it as a tool to ex-
amine other constructs such as students' en-
gagement, self-esteem, play, and preferences. 
In comparison, this paper would utilize ukulele 
as a means of a tool to provide psychosocial 
support to elementary students brought on by 
the mental health threat from COVID-19.  

One great example is from the study of 
Michel and Farrell (1973) in which they inves-
tigated the effects of incorporating musical per-
formances skills through the use of ukulele on 
students' self-esteem. The participants of their 
study were composed of fourteen boys in 
grades four to six who were described by their 
teachers and the country's psychological ser-
vices centres as students who have learning 
and behaviour challenges at school. Each par-
ticipant completed the Self Esteem Inventory 
(SEI) tool, while their teachers completed the 
Behaviour Rating Form (BRF), one for each boy. 
The study lasted for seven and a half weeks, 
while the students participated in half an hour 
ukulele twice a week, with a total of 15 ukulele 
lessons focused on acquiring musical skills. 
Moreover, the participants were able to trade 
their tokens that they have earned for complet-
ing their task for an extra private ukulele lesson 
time with their mentors. Michel and Farrell 
(1973) observed students who participated for 
3 weeks in order to determine if the ukulele les-
sons affected their own task time in class, and 
after completing the 15 lessons the participants 
were instructed to complete the Self Evaluation 
Inventory again. The study findings concluded 

musical skill acquisition contributed and in-
creased the students’ self-esteem as well as in-
creased on-task time. The male students who 
participated demonstrated a 10% increase in 
on-task time which the researchers correlated 
to the students’ motivation to earn more tokens 
to trade for private ukulele lessons.  

Another phenomenological study con-
ducted by Koops (2017) observed 12 children 
from ages four to seven during musical play 
and made a description of their behaviour 
across 24 different sessions. The session lasted 
for about 45 minute-long, and Koops fostered a 
play based musical setting that includes move-
ment, singing, creating, listening, and playing 
instruments one of which is the ukulele. The 
data were from interviews from the children, 
observation, researchers notes and video anal-
ysis. The researcher found that children 
demonstrated feelings of fulfillment and enjoy-
ment during the musical play activity through 
active participation and physical engagement. 
These behaviours were the most prominent 
when the activities incorporated a balance of 
novelty and familiarity. For instance, children 
exhibit success and enjoyment when they 
transfer known vocal songs to the recorder or 
the ukulele. Engagement was also demon-
strated by the children when activities allowed 
for the student to control or have their own 
choice, and when a playful and safe environ-
ment was already established (e.g., when chil-
dren are able to choose whether to participate 
and explore musical play concepts without the 
fear of failure and judgement) (Doebler, 2021).  

Thus, the researcher introduced the Uku-
lele lesson to the Grade 3 pupils from an Inte-
grated School in Pangasinan and tried to look 
into the effect of its integration to the pupils’ 
psychosocial development and academic per-
formance. 
 
The Purpose of the Study  

The purpose of this study is to investigate 
the effect of the integration of Ukulele lessons 
to the Grade 3 pupils’ psychosocial develop-
ment and academic performance. Specifically, 
it seeks to answer the following question: 
1. What is the impact of the program Artistry 

in Music Featuring Ukulele Lesson to the pu-
pils? 



AD Amaroa, 2024 / Psychosocial Support for Grade 3 Pupils Through Artistry in Music Featuring Ukulele Lesson 

 

    
 IJMABER 1190 Volume 5 | Number 4 | April | 2024 

 

2. What is the impact of the program Artistry 
in Music Featuring Ukulele Lesson to the 
teachers? 

3. What is the impact of the Artistry in Music 
Featuring Ukulele Lesson to the school com-
munity? 

 
Scope of the Study 

The study only covered the effect of the in-
tegration of the ukulele lessons to the Grade 3 
pupils. Moreover, school teacher from second-
ary and tertiary education were excluded from 
the participant selection. Only the elementary 
school teachers were qualified for the study. 
 
Methods  
Research Design  

The Innovative Work Plan (IWP) which was 
used in the study was an experimental-purpos-
ive approach which became instrumental in 
implementing the program. The program in-
volved thirty-eight pupils (38) and eleven (11) 
MAPEH teachers for the school year 2022-2023 
from an Integrated School in Pangasinan. Ex-
perimental since only a group of pupils partici-
pated in the program and were tested to de-
velop their skills in playing ukulele and Purpos-
ive in the sense that the participants in this IWP 
were the pupils who were able to provide their 
own instruments, and were deemed to be 
suited for this program. 
 
Participants  

The participants of the study consist of 
thirty-eight pupils (38) and eleven (11) MAPEH 
teachers who were part of school year 2022-
2023 from an Integrated School in Pangasinan. 
 
Data Collection Procedure 

During the implementation of the study, the 
researcher allotted a specific time for the uku-
lele program.   One hour every day from 9am to 
10am was scheduled for those teachers who 
wanted to learn and have their personal ukulele 
tutorial, while the pupils were given one and a 
half hour every day from 10am to 11:30 am. 
This schedule was amenable to the pupils and 
teachers since they were all under afternoon 
class session.  

The program was supported by stakehold-
ers, teachers, and parents, which was shown 

with the large number of participants, not to 
mention there are good hearted individuals who 
donated instruments for the pupils, which was 
properly documented by the researcher and 
submitted to the school as a deed of donation. 
The students were able to utilize the donated in-
struments during their schedule.  
 
Results and Discussion  

The primary focus of this study was to in-
vestigate the effect of the integration of Ukulele 
lessons to the Grade 3 pupils’ psychosocial de-
velopment and academic performance.  
1. What is the Impact of the Program to the 

Pupils? 
The program had made the pupils read mu-

sical sheets and songs, the beauty of reading was 
interconnected to music and that was made pos-
sible in this program. Since playing ukulele re-
quires them to read notes and lyrics the pupils 
were taught how to read. Reading was made fun 
because it was accompanied by music of their 
own instrument, the ukulele. 

Once pupils have grasped the basics of play-
ing the ukulele, they really enjoy playing it. Par-
ents were always reporting to the researcher as 
to how instantly ukulele made their children 
stay in one place and just practice their chord 
progressions at home. The program made the 
pupils avoid using cell phones or play mobile 
games like they used to. Their attention was 
now diverted to playing their instrument. 

Each pupil was given the chance to pick their 
favourite song and learned to play it. In the end, 
every song they learned was a personal achieve-
ment. As a Music teacher, the researcher en-
couraged them to listen or even signing along 
during the music lessons, so that they will have 
a great time playing their musical instrument. 

In addition, playing ukulele or being in a mu-
sical class demands total attention. With that be-
ing said, pupils can now limit their misconduct 
inside the classroom. The noise from unneces-
sary talking and shouting or even playing inside 
the classroom were minimized.  This is one 
proof that music is a great stress-relieving tool 
that helps to calm the mind and enhance con-
centration among pupils and even the teacher. 
As well as being a way of relieving stress, music 
could also help pupils to manage their feelings 
better by expressing them through singing. 
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It gives them the chance to express their emo-
tions through the ukulele they are playing. 

Moreover, these pupils as they became 
members of the ukulele music group learned 
teamwork skills. These pupils play ukulele to-
gether harmoniously, that is where the magic 
happened. In order to improve the pupils’ per-
formance, the researcher always encouraged 
the pupils to attend rehearsals and practice 
playing the ukelele instrument regularly. 

Furthermore, there are various studies 
which have proven that the comprehension of 
musical language can benefit a child's overall 
mental development. One of which was the 
study conducted by Dosseville et al. (2012)  

revealed that music has a positive influence on 
students’ academic performance. After the in-
tervention in control group and experimental 
group, the Multiple-Choice Questionnaire 
(MCQ) was given to assess the students learning 
during the lecture. The results showed that the 
MCQ scores of the students under experimental 
group, those who incorporated music during 
lecture, was significantly higher compared to 
the scores under control group. Figures show 
that pupils who study music are more successful 
on standardized tests and are also likely to 
achieve better grades in school. 

The tables below show the MPS in MAPEH 
from 2nd quarter to 3rd quarter.  

 
Table 1. MPS in Elementary MAPEH Second Quarter 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Table 2. MPS in Elementary MAPEH Third Quarter 
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Based on the given data, there is an increase 
in the level of academic performance of the 
Grade 3 pupils at an Integrated School in Pan-
gasinan with the use of Ukulele lessons as an in-
tervention program focusing on psychosocial 
support.  The findings indicated that there is an 
increased level of performance of the pupils in 
MAPEH. 

 
2. What is the impact of the Program to the 

Teachers? 
The program has a great impact on the ele-

mentary teachers. The majority of the partici-
pant experienced challenges in motivating the 
students to read. Basically, they all cannot read 
when they attend their first day of school. This 
situation made the researcher think of ways on 
how to teach the pupils to love reading and in-
tegrate it in their day-to-day practice. That is 
where the ukulele made a great impact. During 
the first phase of the program, the researcher 
did adapt one stanza of a song, played it to them 
and made them read it on their own with mel-
ody. That has been the pupils’ routine every 
day, the researcher infused reading with music. 
By the time the pupils were ready, the re-
searcher offered them the ukulele lesson. 

As the researcher started doing this in the 
class, some of elementary teachers saw the po-
tential of the program and they were also inter-
ested in learning how to play the ukulele. They 
invested their time every day for one hour to 
learn the basics of ukulele. Some of them 
learned it for personal reasons like it is their 
way of new learning or as a fulfillment of their 
long -time dream of playing an instrument. And 
some teacher learned how to play the instru-
ment to remove some of their stress. While the 
others decided to use it too in their class. One 
out of the eleven teachers that participated 
taught ukulele to her pupils and became con-
stant in practices and rehearsals of how to play 
ukulele.  

The teachers also purchased their own uku-
lele as their personal commitment to learn the 
instrument. And they too pledged their com-
mitment of joining the soon to be concert for a 
cause. 

 
 

3. What is the Impact of the Program to the 
School? 
This program on psychosocial support for 

grade 3 pupils through artistry in music featur-
ing ukulele lessons has been supported by the 
stakeholders. It was first launched with the 
stakeholders and also conducted an orientation 
with the parents of the pupils who participated 
in the program and was then later on chosen to 
be a part of the schools’ program.  

This was indicated by the school’s ESIP for 
the school year 2022-2023. As indicated it was 
used as a psychosocial program for the pupils. 
The former and current school head also saw 
the potential of the program and that the pro-
gram can cater more pupils in the school. The 
researcher was reassigned to handle an inter-
mediate class, the Grade 5 class that the re-
searcher can possibly teach more pupils and 
provide them the ukulele lessons.  

Furthermore, one of the sustainability plans 
of the program, which was to cater to more pu-
pils and possibly offer guitar lessons was real-
ized. Since guitar lessons were now also offered 
to the pupils in addition to the ukulele lessons to 
a much wider and bigger population of the pu-
pils in the school.  

Teaching ukulele and guitar has been one of 
the personal commitments of the researcher as 
a teacher, that teaching the pupils the beauty of 
learning at least one instrument in their life as 
elementary pupils. 

As such, the program made the whole school 
organization united in helping the pupils pro-
cess their feelings and emotions while enjoying 
what they do, play ukulele. This has opened var-
ious opportunities for the school to provide psy-
chosocial support to its pupils. This has also de-
creased the concern of the parents regarding 
their children’ psychosocial well-being in 
school.   

 
Conclusion  
1. The program made the pupils avoid using 

cell phones or play mobile games like they 
used to. Their attention was now diverted 
to playing their instrument. Another thing, 
playing ukulele or being in a musical class 
demands total attention. With that being 
said, pupils can now limit their misconduct 
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inside the classroom. The noise from un-
necessary talking and shouting or even 
playing inside the classroom were mini-
mized through this program. Koops (2017) 
found that children demonstrated feelings 
of fulfilment and enjoyment during the mu-
sical play activity through active participa-
tion and physical engagement.  This is one 
proof that music is a great stress-relieving 
tool that helps to calm the mind and en-
hance concentration among pupils and 
even the teacher. As well as being a way of 
relieving stress, music could also help pu-
pils to manage their feelings better by ex-
pressing them through singing. Based on 
the given data, there is an increase in the 
level of academic performance of the Grade 
3 pupils at an Integrated School in Pan-
gasinan with the use of Ukulele lessons as 
an intervention program focusing on psy-
chosocial support.  The findings indicated 
that there is an increased level of perfor-
mance of the pupils in MAPEH. 

2. The program has a great impact on the ele-
mentary teachers.  Majority of the partici-
pant experienced challenges in motivating 
the students to read. Basically, they all can-
not read when they attend their first day of 
school. This situation made the researcher 
think of ways on how to teach the pupils to 
love reading and integrate it in their day-to-
day practice. That is where the ukulele 
made a great impact. Dyer (2011) suggests 
that incorporating music in classes in-
creases primary students' class participa-
tion and engagement in school activities. 
Music also helps with memory and recall as 
well as in enhancing phonemic awareness 
during literacy instructions. Students are 
now able to enjoy the idea of reading 
through the integration of music in it. As 
much as music improves learning helps 
create a conductive learning environment 
and inspires creativity it can serve a strong 
hold and maintain cohesiveness in a class-
room. It can be deemed necessary to instil 
the importance of reading to the elemen-
tary pupils as this will become their foun-
dation on the succeeding school year.  
Doebler (2021) mentioned that students 
who collaboratively work to make their 

own class song that they can use at the be-
ginning or even at the end of their class 
maintain classroom cohesiveness.  

3. This program on psychosocial support for 
grade 3 pupils through artistry in music 
featuring ukulele lessons has been sup-
ported by the stakeholders. As such, the 
program made the whole school organiza-
tion united in helping the pupils process 
their feelings and emotions while enjoying 
what they do, play ukulele. Smith and Secoy 
(2019), explained that the concept of using 
music activities as an alternative way to re-
duce habituation works well in classroom 
situations. Using music and various sounds 
in the classroom can decrease the habitua-
tion effect, increase students’ brain activity, 
and ensure that the teacher is being heard 
by the students.  This has opened various 
opportunities for the school to provide psy-
chosocial support to its pupils. This has also 
decreased the concern of the parents re-
garding their children’ psychosocial well-
being in school. 
 

Recommendations 
The results of the study finding should 

serve as a recommendation to integrate the use 
of musical instrument to positively influence 
the students’ psychosocial well-being and their 
academic performance. Since the study focused 
on elementary pupils, studying the effects of 
this specific type of musical intervention across 
various age range may perhaps provide under-
standing into its usefulness in the secondary 
and tertiary students. 
  
References  
Bernard, C., & Cayari, C. (2020). Encouraging 

participatory music-making through dif-
ferentiation on the ukulele. General Music 
Today, 34(1), 29–36. 
https://doi.org/10.1177/104837132092
6608  

Bonsaksen, T., Chiu, V., Leung, J., Schoultz, M., 
Thygesen, H., Price, D., Ruffolo, M., & Geir-
dal, A. Ø. (2022). Students’ Mental Health, 
Well-Being, and Loneliness during the 
COVID-19 Pandemic: A Cross-National 
Study. Healthcare, 10(6), 996. 

https://doi.org/10.1177/1048371320926608
https://doi.org/10.1177/1048371320926608


AD Amaroa, 2024 / Psychosocial Support for Grade 3 Pupils Through Artistry in Music Featuring Ukulele Lesson 

 

    
 IJMABER 1194 Volume 5 | Number 4 | April | 2024 

 

https://doi.org/10.3390/healthcare1006
0996  

Department of Education. (2021).  Mental 
Health and Psychosocial Support. 
https://training.deped.gov.ph/course/in-
dex.php?categoryid=63  

DiDomenico, J. (2017). Effective Integration of 
Music in the Elementary School Class-
room: inquiry in education: Vol. 9: Iss. 2, 
Article 4. https://digitalcom-
mons.nl.edu/ie/vol9/iss2/4  

Doebler, Grace (2021) "Ukulele in Music Class: 
Teachers’ Perspectives," Visions of Re-
search in Music Education: Vol. 38 , Article 
2.  https://opencom-
mons.uconn.edu/vrme/vol38/iss1/2  

Doebler, G. (2021). "Ukulele in Music Class: 
Teachers’ Perspectives," Visions of Re-
search in Music Education: Vol. 38 , Article 
2. https://opencom-
mons.uconn.edu/vrme/vol38/iss1/2   

Dosseville, F., Laborde, S., & Scelles, N. (2012). 
Music during lectures: Will students learn 
better? Learning and Individual Differ-
ences, 22(2), 258–262. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.lin-
dif.2011.10.004  

Dyer, J. L. (2011). Musical thought: Using music 
to enhance literacy instruction. Illinois 
Reading Council Journal, 39(4), 3-9. 

Giebelhausen, R. (2016). So, you're thinking 
about starting a ukulele program? General 
Music Today, 29(3), 38–41. 
https://doi.org/10.1177/104837131562
5294  

Giebelhausen, R., & Kruse, A. J. (2018). "A smile 
on everybody's face": A multiple case 
study of community ukulele groups. Inter-
national Journal of Music Education, 
36(3), 347–365.  
https://doi.org/10.1177/025576141774
4371   

Hornilla, V. (n.d).  Music Education in Philip-
pines Primary and Secondary Schools. 
https://ncca.gov.ph/about-ncca-3/sub-
commissions/subcommission-on-the-
arts-sca/music/music-education-in-phil-
ippines-primary-and-secondary-schools/  

Koops, L. (2017). The enjoyment cycle: A phe-
nomenology of musical enjoyment of 4- to 
7-year-olds during musical play. Journal 

of Research in Music Education, 65(3), 
360–380. 
https://doi.org/10.1177/002242941771
6921  

Kruse, N. (2013). "Without U, it's just ukulele": 
Expressions of leisure and 'ohana in an in-
tergenerational ukulele club. Interna-
tional Journal of Community Music, 6(2), 
153–167. 
https://doi.org/10.1386/ijcm.6.2.153_1  

Lleogo, M. A. (2022). Remote psychosocial sup-
port through play for elementary learners. 
Teacher PH. https://www.teach-
erph.com/remote-psychosocial-support-
through-play-elementary-learners/  

Mental Health Act, R.A 11036. (2018). 
https://lawphil.net/statutes/re-
pacts/ra2018/ra_11036_2018.html  

Michel, D. E., & Farrell, D. M. (1973). Music and 
self-esteem: Disadvantaged problem boys 
in an all-black elementary school. Journal 
of Research in Music Education, 21(1), 
80–84. 
https://doi.org/10.2307/3343983  

Molebatsi, K., Musindo, O., Ntlantsana, V., & 
Wambua, G. N. (2021). Mental health and 
Psychosocial support during COVID-19: A 
review of health guidelines in Sub-Sa-
haran Africa. Frontiers in Psychiatry, 12. 
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyt.2021.571
342  

Smith, R., & Secoy, J. (2019). Exploring the mu-
sic identity development of elementary 
education majors using ukulele and 
YouTube. Journal of Music Teacher Educa-
tion, 29(1), 71-85. 
https://doi.org/10.1177/105708371987
1026  

Thibeault, M. D., & Evoy, J. (2011). Building 
your own musical community: How 
YouTube, Miley Cyrus, and the ukulele can 
create a new kind of ensemble. General 
Music Today, 24(3), 44–52. 
https://doi.org/10.1177/104837131039
7348  

World Health Organization. (2020). Mental 
health and psychosocial considerations 
during the COVID-19 outbreak. 
https://www.who.int/docs/default-
source/coronaviruse/mental-health-
considerations.pdf 

 
 

 
 

https://doi.org/10.3390/healthcare10060996
https://doi.org/10.3390/healthcare10060996
https://training.deped.gov.ph/course/index.php?categoryid=63
https://training.deped.gov.ph/course/index.php?categoryid=63
https://digitalcommons.nl.edu/ie/vol9/iss2/4
https://digitalcommons.nl.edu/ie/vol9/iss2/4
https://opencommons.uconn.edu/vrme/vol38/iss1/2
https://opencommons.uconn.edu/vrme/vol38/iss1/2
https://opencommons.uconn.edu/vrme/vol38/iss1/2
https://opencommons.uconn.edu/vrme/vol38/iss1/2
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.lindif.2011.10.004
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.lindif.2011.10.004
https://doi.org/10.1177/1048371315625294
https://doi.org/10.1177/1048371315625294
https://doi.org/10.1177/0255761417744371
https://doi.org/10.1177/0255761417744371
https://ncca.gov.ph/about-ncca-3/subcommissions/subcommission-on-the-arts-sca/music/music-education-in-philippines-primary-and-secondary-schools/
https://ncca.gov.ph/about-ncca-3/subcommissions/subcommission-on-the-arts-sca/music/music-education-in-philippines-primary-and-secondary-schools/
https://ncca.gov.ph/about-ncca-3/subcommissions/subcommission-on-the-arts-sca/music/music-education-in-philippines-primary-and-secondary-schools/
https://ncca.gov.ph/about-ncca-3/subcommissions/subcommission-on-the-arts-sca/music/music-education-in-philippines-primary-and-secondary-schools/
https://doi.org/10.1177/0022429417716921
https://doi.org/10.1177/0022429417716921
https://doi.org/10.1386/ijcm.6.2.153_1
https://www.teacherph.com/remote-psychosocial-support-through-play-elementary-learners/
https://www.teacherph.com/remote-psychosocial-support-through-play-elementary-learners/
https://www.teacherph.com/remote-psychosocial-support-through-play-elementary-learners/
https://lawphil.net/statutes/repacts/ra2018/ra_11036_2018.html
https://lawphil.net/statutes/repacts/ra2018/ra_11036_2018.html
https://doi.org/10.2307/3343983
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyt.2021.571342
https://doi.org/10.3389/fpsyt.2021.571342
https://doi.org/10.1177/1057083719871026
https://doi.org/10.1177/1057083719871026
https://doi.org/10.1177/1048371310397348
https://doi.org/10.1177/1048371310397348
https://www.who.int/docs/default-source/coronaviruse/mental-health-considerations.pdf
https://www.who.int/docs/default-source/coronaviruse/mental-health-considerations.pdf
https://www.who.int/docs/default-source/coronaviruse/mental-health-considerations.pdf

