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ABSTRACT 

 

The study makes the case that adding social media campaign tactics 

to the requirements for local office holders will encourage more re-

sponsible, knowledgeable, and involved grassroots politics. This 

study explores the qualification standards for local candidates and 

how these standards can be redefined in the context of social media 

campaigns. As digital channels have a greater influence on voter in-

volvement and perception, identifying the criteria that resonate with 

people becomes critical. The study highlights important characteris-

tics—such as ethics, community involvement, and digital literacy—

that distinguish successful local candidates. The study presents a 

methodology for optimizing campaign messaging and outreach by 

studying the candidates' successful social media techniques. Finally, 

the findings aim to help future politicians use social media to increase 

democratic engagement and develop meaningful ties with voters. 

This study emphasizes the essential interplay of candidate qualities 

and internet campaigning in determining electoral results. 
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Introduction 
In the evolving landscape of political cam-

paigning, the use of new media has trans-
formed how candidates engage with voters, 
and this study focuses on the analysis of local 
political advertisements in new media (blogs, 

social media, streaming services, mobiles apps) 
and their impact on the political perspectives of 
voters in Valenzuela's 2nd Congressional Dis-
trict. By examining the content of these political 
ads, the research aims to uncover how voters 
perceive candidates' qualifications based on 
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various factors, including profession, experi-
ence, personality, priorities, and education. 
Furthermore, the study seeks to explore the 
distinctions in perceptions between expert  
voters and mainstream voters. Expert voters 
are those with a more informed and critical 
view of politics, individuals who are highly 
knowledgeable about political issues, candi-
dates, and the electoral process. They often en-
gage deeply with political content, relying on 
detailed analysis and research to inform their 
decisions. and mainstream voters, who may 
rely on more traditional forms of political mes-
saging. Mainstream voters, typically refers to 
the majority of voters who share generally held 
political opinions and behaviors in a certain so-
ciety. They frequently endorse major political 
parties and policies that match traditional val-
ues and interests. This group tends to hold 
moderate views and may be affected by main-
stream media and established political dis-
course. It investigates whether political adver-
tisements adhere to established content, advo-
cacy, professional, and ethical standards while 
identifying key elements of social media ads 
that influence voter ideologies and decisions. 
The research will also highlight which candi-
date qualifications promoted through these ads 
are most effective in shaping voter preferences 
and will delve into the political campaign strat-
egies employed by candidates' supporters. The 
significance of this study reaches beyond aca-
demic inquiry, offering valuable insights for 
various stakeholders; national and local gov-
ernments can leverage the findings to enhance 
voter education and awareness regarding polit-
ical choices, politicians may discover more ef-
fective strategies for utilizing social media in 
their campaigns, and the general public can 
gain a better understanding of how political ad-
vertisements shape voting behaviors. Addition-
ally, this research contributes to the broader 
field of study by proposing a voter education 
program and serving as a reference for future 
scholars interested in exploring the influence of 
new media on voter perceptions and decisions, 
while it is important to note that the scope of 
this study is confined to the analysis of political 
ad content, without assessing the overall effec-
tiveness of social media in political campaigns. 

An examination of related literature 
demonstrates the importance of social media in 
modern political campaigns, beginning with 
Barack Obama's 2012 presidential campaign. 
According to Newman (2016), whereas  
Romney employed social media, Obama com-
pletely embraced channels such as Facebook, 
Twitter, Instagram, and YouTube to engage di-
rectly with voters, communicate with his fans, 
and humanize his campaign image (Yanes and 
Carter 2012). This technique enabled him to es-
tablish a strong social brand, with his campaign 
mainly reliant on social media participation, ce-
menting his status as the first "social media 
president" (Pătruţ, 2014). The literature also 
emphasizes that political politicians are in-
creasingly using social media not only to pro-
mote their agendas, but also as a defensive 
mechanism in times of crisis. Johnson and 
Brown (2018) and Thurber and Nelson (2014) 
argue that social media allows candidates to 
engage in competitive strategy, particularly 
during controversies, as demonstrated by Don-
ald Trump's use of Twitter to respond to the re-
lease of a controversial audio clip during the 
2016 election (Kuypers, 2018; Martinez, 2017). 

In addition to social media, the examination 
examines the role of money and the internet in 
political campaigns. While financial resources 
are important, they do not necessarily ensure 
success, as evidenced by US elections in which 
candidates outspent opponents but still lost 
(Newman, 2016). Elections in the Philippines 
are structured by a clientelistic political cul-
ture, and campaigns frequently reflect elite 
domination, despite efforts to increase trans-
parency through laws such as the Campaign Fi-
nance Reform Bill (Thurber and Nelson, 2014). 
The literature also underscores the internet's 
expanding importance in worldwide elections, 
particularly in Asia, where political parties are 
increasingly using online platforms to cam-
paign. For example, in the 2007 elections in the 
Philippines, the Gabriela Women's Party used 
social networking platforms such as YouTube 
and Friendster to overcome limited resources 
and interact with voters, setting a precedent for 
women's political empowerment in the area 
(Kuypers, 2018). 
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The evolution of political communication in 
the Philippines has been significantly shaped 
by the introduction of the Internet in 1994, pri-
marily through traditional telephone technol-
ogy and PABX networks (Villafania, 2004). Ini-
tial applications of the Internet in the political 
sphere were noted during the protests against 
President Estrada, which culminated in the 
People Power II movement (Cuevas, 2007; Mi-
randilla, 2007). However, despite the historic 
role of the Internet in mobilizing political sen-
timents, the effectiveness of online platforms 
for sustained political engagement in the Phil-
ippines remains underexplored. Studies by 
Cuevas (2004) and Mirandilla (2007) suggest 
that online political communication largely 
mimics offline practices, with candidates rely-
ing on one-way communication and limited in-
teraction with the electorate. This dynamic was 
evident during the 2007 elections, where new 
media technologies were underutilized by the 
Gabriela Women's Party (GWP), which strug-
gled to maximize online platforms for effective 
political campaigning. Although GWP em-
ployed mobile phones successfully, its website 
and social networking initiatives lagged be-
hind, highlighting the digital divide in the coun-
try and the limitations of Internet-based politi-
cal strategies in a context where the majority 
still lacked access to the web. 

The political landscape in other parts of the 
world, however, illustrates the transformative 
power of the Internet and social media in cam-
paigns. In the U.S., political candidates like 
President Obama utilized websites and social 
media to create interactive and participatory 
campaign environments, enabling grassroots 
movements and substantial fundraising efforts 
(Lenvenshus, 2021). This contrasts sharply 
with the experience of GWP, where traditional 
media and mobile communication were more 
effective. Social media, such as Facebook and 
Twitter, have redefined political campaigning, 
particularly among younger voters, allowing 
for candidate-driven campaigns where per-
sonal branding overshadows political parties 
(Pollard et al., 2019). This shift towards per-
sonalized political communication is exempli-
fied in Obama’s successful use of these plat-
forms, fostering civic participation and creating 
a direct link between voters and candidates 

(Vonderschmitt, 2021). While the Internet has 
introduced new dynamics into political dis-
course, challenges remain, such as the rise of 
soundbite culture, which can oversimplify po-
litical messaging and distort public perception 
(Hacker, 2004). Overall, the use of digital media 
has fundamentally altered political communi-
cation, though its application in different re-
gions varies depending on technological access 
and cultural contexts. 

Social media played a critical role in the last 
Philippine elections, changing the way politi-
cians connected with voters. Platforms such as 
Facebook and Twitter enabled candidates to 
convey their messages rapidly and directly, 
reaching a large number of voters, particularly 
young people, without relying on traditional 
media. However, the rise of social media has 
presented considerable issues, notably in 
terms of misinformation. Many political groups 
used fake information to influence public opin-
ion, confusing voters about what was true. This 
made it more difficult for individuals to find 
credible information, raising questions about 
the impartiality of the election process. Influ-
encers and celebrities had a significant impact 
on the elections. To capitalize on their big fol-
lowings, candidates frequently sought endorse-
ments from well-known celebrities. This tech-
nique was especially effective with younger 
voters, who are more likely to trust these well-
known figures, shifting the emphasis from tra-
ditional political credentials to social media 
presence. Furthermore, social media facilitated 
grassroots mobilization by allowing ordinary 
folks to arrange events and conversations. This 
contributed to a stronger sense of community 
and increased voter turnout. To summarize, so-
cial media had a huge impact on the last Philip-
pine elections by changing how candidates 
communicated with voters and shaping public 
conversation. While it created new opportuni-
ties for engagement, it also raised concerns 
about misinformation and the integrity of the 
democratic process. As social media evolves, 
the impact on future elections will be critical to 
monitor. 

The study aims to analyze the content of lo-
cal political ads in new media and their impact 
on Filipino voters' political perspectives in 
Valenzuela's 2nd Congressional District. It  
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focuses on understanding how voters perceive 
candidates' qualifications in terms of profes-
sion, experience, personality, priorities, and ed-
ucation, as well as assessing the difference in 
perception between expert and mainstream 
voters. The study examines whether political 
ads adhere to content, advocacy, professional, 
and ethical standards, and seeks to identify the 
aspects of social media ads that influence voter 
ideologies and decisions. Additionally, it ex-
plores which candidate qualifications pro-
moted through ads influence voter preferences 
and investigates political campaign strategies 
used by candidates' supporters. 

This study contributes significantly to the 
literature on political communication and voter 
behavior in the Philippines by investigating 
how social media affects views of local political 
advertisements. It emphasizes the importance 
of internet participation in voter mobilization 
and addresses the significant issue of misinfor-
mation, highlighting the necessity for media lit-
eracy and regulatory measures to improve 
electoral integrity. By comparing assessments 
from diverse groups, such as political special-
ists and mainstream voters, we gain insight 
into how different populations interpret politi-
cal communications, which may be used to cre-
ate targeted election efforts. Furthermore, this 
study seeks to fill significant gaps in the exist-
ing literature, specifically the scarcity of in-
depth investigations on local political adver-
tisements in diverse cultural contexts. While 
past research has concentrated on national 
elections, these findings highlight the impact of 
new media on local political dynamics and 
voter involvement. Using quantitative analyses 
such as the weighted mean and t-test strength-
ens the validity of our findings and provides a 
rigorous foundation for future research. Over-
all, this research not only fills these gaps but 

also broadens our understanding of social me-
dia's evolving role in political communication, 
with implications for both academic research 
and practical electoral strategy. 

The significance of the study extends to var-
ious stakeholders. It can guide national and lo-
cal governments in promoting voter education 
and enhancing awareness about political 
choices. Politicians may use the study's findings 
to better utilize social media for effective cam-
paign strategies, while the public can benefit 
from insights into how political ads shape vot-
ing decisions. The study also contributes to the 
research field, proposing a voter education pro-
gram and serving as a resource for future re-
searchers exploring the influence of new media 
on voter perceptions and decisions. This study 
focuses exclusively on analyzing the content of 
political ads without assessing the overall ef-
fectiveness of social media in political cam-
paigns. 

This study, grounded in Social Influence 
Theory, analyzes the content of local political 
advertisements and their impact on voter ide-
als and decision-making regarding candidate 
selection. It examines various elements of po-
litical ads, including style, emotion, honesty, 
and persuasion, while also assessing adherence 
to content, advocacy, professional, and ethical 
standards set by mass media. The research 
identifies key aspects of social media political 
ads that significantly influence voter decisions 
and ideologies, ranking the qualifications of lo-
cal candidates based on their effect on voter 
preferences. Additionally, the study analyzes 
the political strategies employed by candidates 
during their campaigns on social media. Ulti-
mately, the goal is to propose an advocacy pro-
gram aimed at increasing voter awareness and 
education, empowering them to make in-
formed choices independent of political ads.
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Figure 1. Conceptual Paradigm of the Study 
 

Methodology 
Research Design 

The descriptive method, quantitative type, 
and correlation design of research will be used 
by the researcher in this research to assess the 
contents of political advertisements of the local 
candidates and the preference of the Filipino 
Voters. According to Aiken (2021) descriptive 
research is research designed to provide a 
snapshot of the current state of affairs and cor-
relational research is research designed to dis-
cover relationships among variables and to al-
low the prediction of future events from pre-
sent knowledge. Research design is the specific 
method a researcher uses to collect, to analyze, 
and interpret data. Most researchers use three 
major types of research designs in their re-
search, and each provides an essential avenue 
for scientific investigation. Descriptive re-
search is research designed to provide a snap-
shot of the current state of affairs. Correlational 
research is research designed to discover rela-
tionships among variables and to allow the pre-
diction of future events from present 
knowledge. 

 

Population, Sample, and Sampling Technique 
The population to be considered in this par-

ticular research wherein the target sample as 
respondents of the study were composed of po-
litical experts and voters from the mainstream.  
There would be two (2) groups of respondents 
for this study.  First, there would be twenty (20) 
“expert”-respondents who are either in line 
with the mass media, journalism, or politics. 
Then the second group would be composed of 
399 respondents from the 2nd Congressional 
District of Valenzuela City. This is based on the 
computation using Slovin’s Formula from the 
total population of 394,703 as of 2023 (source: 
Planning Office, Valenzuela City).  It has opted 
to focus on groups such as political specialists 
and mainstream voters because they offer val-
uable viewpoints on the impact of social media 
on elections. Political specialists provide in-
formed views into electoral dynamics, cam-
paign methods, and the impact of social media 
on political communication. The investigations 
contribute to understanding the complexities 
of how social media influences voter behavior 
and candidate strategies, as well as measuring 
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the impact of misinformation and disinfor-
mation operations on public perception and 
trust in the political process. This knowledge 
can help to shape proposals for controlling so-
cial media use in elections, adding to discus-
sions concerning electoral integrity. On the 
other hand, mainstream voters make up a siza-
ble section of the electorate, making their view-
points critical for determining how social me-
dia influences voting behavior, preferences, 
and engagement. It can study this group's inter-
actions with social media, including platform 
usage and content kinds that appeal to them, 
which can influence their political participa-
tion. Insights from mainstream voters can also 
reveal patterns in voting behavior, such as 
shifts in party alignment or greater involve-
ment as a result of social media engagement. 
The study's goal is to provide a thorough un-
derstanding of how social media impacts polit-
ical discourse, mobilizes support, and influ-
ences election outcomes by looking at both po-
litical specialists and mainstream voters. This 
dual approach enhances the study and pro-
vides useful recommendations for future elec-
toral strategies and policies. 

 
Research Instrument 

In the assessment of content analysis on the 
Local Political Ads in the New Media and an as-
sessment on the political perspectives of Fili-
pino Voters, the self-formulated survey instru-
ment was used in the main data gathering in-
strument.  The survey questionnaire was for-
mulated with the guidance of the adviser which 
was used in order to gather the primary data 
for this research. The formulated questionnaire 
is anchored to the adopted theory in the assess-
ment of the content analysis on the Local Polit-
ical Ads in the New Media and an assessment 
on the political perspectives of Filipino Voters.  
Likewise, the researcher used the interview 
guide questions as support to the data that 
were gathered through the use of the survey in-
strument. The interview guide was designed in 
accordance with the content analysis on the Lo-
cal Political Ads in the New Media and an as-
sessment on the political perspectives of Fili-
pino Voters.  The questionnaire and interview 
guide questions were developed through a se-

ries of consultations and evaluation of ques-
tions concerning the subject matter in order to 
find answers to the questions which are posted 
in the statement of the problem.  

Moreover, the formulated survey question-
naire that was in this study was composed of 
two significant parts. The first part of the ques-
tionnaire presented the content analysis on the 
Local Political Ads in the New Media. The four 
point scale was used in the assessment with the 
highest rating is equivalent to strongly agree, 
while the lowest rating is equivalent to strongly 
disagree.   

The second and the last part of the ques-
tionnaire was composed of the and an assess-
ment on the political perspectives of Filipino 
Voters. The four point scale used in the assess-
ment with the highest rating is equivalent to 
strongly agree, while the lowest rating is equiv-
alent to strongly disagree.   

The research instrument which is the self-
formulated questionnaire was validated before 
its actual administration to the target respond-
ents. The research conducted a dry-run of the 
questionnaire using printed and Google Forms. 
This pilot testing or dry run was conducted at 
Malabon City.  The pre-test was distributed to 
30 pilot respondents. The target respondents 
for the validation of the questionnaire were 
composed of 15 political experts and 15 voters 
from the mainstream. The respondents for pre-
test were not included as the actual respond-
ents of the study. The validation was conducted 
in order to determine its reliability and to make 
sure that the items or indicators are clear, con-
cise, and precise. 

 
Data Gathering Procedures 

The gathering of data for this particular re-
search started with seeking the permission of 
the political experts and the target respondents 
who are involved in the assessment of the con-
tent analysis on the Local Political Ads in the 
New Media and an assessment on the political 
perspectives of Filipino Voters. Then, the vali-
dated and approved final questionnaire to-
gether with the interview guide was printed. 
The questionnaires were distributed to the tar-
get respondents of the study together with an 
approved letter to conduct the study.  
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Moreover, the researchers may communi-
cate directly to the target respondents of the 
study. The researcher conducted follow-up to 
the target participants for their response. The 
researcher also accepted questions and verifi-
cation from the target respondents concerning 
the contents of the survey questionnaire. The 
responses were consolidated and will be tal-
lied. In addition, the researcher provides assur-
ance to the target respondents that all re-
sponses were treated with utmost confidential-
ity.  

 Moreover, unstructured interview, obser-
vation, and documentary analysis were done 
by the researcher to broaden the range of the 
discussions about the topic being investigated. 
The conducted documentary analysis provided 
relevant information about the content analy-
sis on the Local Political Ads in the New Media 
and an assessment on the political perspectives 
of Filipino Voters from both local and foreign 
sources. The results of analysis of the available 
documents which are related to content analy-
sis on the Local Political Ads in the New Media 
and an assessment on the political perspectives 
of Filipino Voters were compared to the results 
of the survey questionnaire. The possible re-
sults of the documentary analysis were used as 
support to the outcome of the study which is 
the voters education program.   

Furthermore, after the administration and 
retrieval of the accomplished questionnaires, 
the gathered data were collated, tabulated, and 
tallied for the application of statistical treat-
ment which was done electronically with the 
use of Microsoft excel prior to application of 
SPSS for electronic computation. The statistical 
results were presented in a table format, being 
analyzed and interpreted, and the guidance of 
the research adviser.  

 
 

Statistical Treatment of Data 
After collating all the data, the researchers 

made an in-depth analysis and interpretation 
of the data using the following statistical tool: 
1 Weighted Mean. The weighted mean was 

used to determine the average of responses 
in a given question. This tool is used to 
measure the average of the scores given in 
each indicator. This tool was used to pre-
sent the answer stating understatement of 
the problem 1 and 3.  By computing the 
weighted mean, it can gain a more nuanced 
understanding of respondents' attitudes 
about local political advertisements via 
new media. This is critical for learning how 
different factors influence voter percep-
tions since it prioritizes replies that are re-
garded more influential or significant. The 
weighted mean guarantees that the find-
ings appropriately represent the average 
judgment of the indicators that were evalu-
ated. 

2 t test. This tool was utilized in testing the 
hypothesis which is to find out if there is a 
significant difference in the assessment of 
two groups of respondents. Moreover, the 
scale was utilized in this research. The scale 
was used in the assessment on the content 
analysis on the Local Political Ads in the 
New Media and an assessment on the polit-
ical perspectives of Filipino Voters. Using 
the t-test, it can quantify how much these 
groups differ in their evaluations of local 
political ads and political beliefs. This tech-
nique is critical for confirming the study 
topics since it determines whether ob-
served differences are statistically signifi-
cant or due to chance. The t-test thus 
strengthens the conclusions by providing 
evidence that helps understand the dynam-
ics at work in the political landscape.

Value  Limits  Adjectival Interpretation 

4 3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree (SA) 
3 2.01-3.00  Agree (A) 
2 1.01-2.00  Disagree (D) 
1   0.01 – 1.00  Strongly Disagree (SD) 



Gajudo et al., 2024 / Revisiting Qualification Standards for Local Candidates 

 

    
 IJMABER 4654 Volume 5 | Number 11 | November | 2024 

 

Together, these statistical methods thor-
oughly assess the data gathered for the investi-
gation. The weighted mean provides insight 
into Filipino voters' general perceptions of lo-
cal political commercials, whereas the t-test en-
ables to investigate variances in these percep-
tions among groups. Using these methodolo-
gies, it can effectively answer the study ques-
tions, presenting a more complete picture of 
how new media influences political opinions 
and advertising efficacy in the Philippines. This 
mix of approaches assures that the findings are 
both trustworthy and significant, adding to the 
larger conversation on political communica-
tion and voter involvement. 

 
Ethical Consideration 

Since all research subjects have moral and 
legal rights, ethical considerations are re-
quired. For this study, the researcher ensured 
that they connected with the participants in a 
personal way, did not breach their privacy 
without their consent, did not harm their feel-
ings, and acknowledged and accurately re-
flected the information obtained from them. 
These are important features according to 
Greetham (2009) and Walliman and Buckler 
(2008).  

Moreover, the following ethical considera-
tions were applied during the actual conduct of 
the study.  

Informed Consent. The consent of the target 
respondents will be secured prior to distribu-
tion of the survey questionnaire. In the case of 
minors, the consent will be coming from the 
parents or guardian.  

Voluntary Participation. The consent form 
explains the research study you are being 
asked to participate in. Please read carefully 
and understand the form and ask if you have 
questions or clarifications before you agree to 
participate. Participants have the right to with-
draw from the study at any stage if they wish to 
do so, if they feel uncomfortable with the pro-
cess.  

Possible Harm. The use of offensive, dis-
criminatory, or other unacceptable was strictly 
prohibited in the Questionnaire. All questions 
used in the survey are all validated by the ad-
viser. 

Privacy and Anonymity. The respondent is 
of paramount importance. All information was 
protected as per mandated by RA 10173 or 
data privacy act of 2012. 

Proper Citation. Acknowledgement of 
works of other authors used in any part of the 
research paper with the use of APA referencing 
system according to the latest edition of univer-
sity research guide. 

Potential Risk. The researcher does not 
foresee any harm or risk in participating in the 
research while participating in the study as 
their personal data and privacy of the results 
were ensured. It is stated in the questionnaire 
“you may decline to answer any of the ques-
tions and withdraw of your participation if you 
feel discomfort”. 

Benefit. There is no direct / instant benefit 
for the participants but this research is de-
signed for the enhancement or improvement of 
the current system.  

Confidentiality. Any data or information col-
lected on this research were protected, anony-
mous and with utmost confidentiality. No indi-
vidual identities were disclosed in any reports 
on this research. Only researchers would never 
reveal the identity of the respondents and their 
responses as well to anyone. 

 
Results and Discussions 

Table 1 presents the qualification of local 
candidates based on the preference of the vot-
ers in terms of profession. As shown in the ta-
ble, a famous celebrity obtained the highest rat-
ing which indicates that the majority of the Fil-
ipino voters choose the local candidate who are 
well-known by the public. This is the reason 
why most celebrities or television personalities 
are very popular. They are easily remembered 
when their political advertisements show a 
good public image that can easily be remem-
bered by the audience. Other professions that 
are considered as strongly agree by respond-
ents include: great practicing lawyer; an econ-
omist; renowned successful businessman; and 
a prominent public servant. The results entail a 
profession which makes an individual become 
popular and increase the level of trust and  
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confidence of the people. Thus, the advantage 
of celebrity among politicians is less political 
advertisement since they are already popular 

and always seen by the public in national tele-
vision.  

 
Table 1. Qualification of Local Candidate Based on Voters’ Preference in terms of Profession 

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  

WM VI WM VI AWM VI 
1. famous celebrity  3.75 SA 3.55 SA 3.65 SA 
2. a great practicing lawyer 3.52 SA 3.35 A 3.44 A 
3. an economist 3.55 SA 3.70 SA 3.63 SA 

4. renowned successful businessman 3.46 A 3.55 SA 3.51 A 
5. a prominent public servant 3.51 SA 3.50 SA 3.51 SA 
OWM 3.56 SA 3.53 SA 3.55 SA 

Legend:   
WM -weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
OWM - overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   
      3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree (SA) 
      2.01-3.00  Agree   (A)  
      1.01-2.00  Disagree   (D) 

     0.01-1.00  Strongly Disagree  (SD) 
 
In relation to this finding, Vonderschmitt 

(2021) emphasized that a political campaign is 
carefully crafted for each candidate, to address 
their constituency and present the candidate 
and party in the best possible way. After the 
creation of the United States, suffrage was lim-
ited to land owning white men, these men were 
involved in politics by reading local newspa-
pers and visiting the politicians face to face. 
However, as we fast forward to the 1930’s Pres-
ident Franklin D. Roosevelt used the radio to 
connect with the American public, and then in 
1960’s Nixon and Kennedy’s debate introduced 

the mass-produced version of face-to-face poli-
tics through televisions all over the country we 
begin our descent into celebrity politics. This 
advance in technology has created more oppor-
tunity for citizens to participate, as they learn 
more about each candidate and have easier ac-
cess to the candidates themselves. Nott (2020) 
claimed that political advertising is a form of 
campaigning that allows candidates to directly 
convey their message to voters and influence 
the political debate. By running ads on various 
types of media, candidates can reach audiences.  

 
Table 2. Qualification of Local Candidate Based on Voters’ Preference in terms of Experience 

Legend:   
WM-weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
OWM- overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  

WM VI WM VI AWM VI 

1. work in private institution as bidder in gov-
ernment projects 

3.65 SA 3.75 SA 3.70 SA 

2. working in non-governmental organization 3.76 SA 3.80 SA 3.78 SA 

3. was elected as government official 3.77 SA 3.85 SA 3.81 SA 

4. being a government employee  3.74 SA 3.65 SA 3.70 SA 

5. has no significant experience in politics 3.58 SA 3.35 A 3.47 A 

OWM 3.70 SA 3.68 SA 3.69 SA 
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      3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree  (SA) 
      2.01-3.00  Agree    (A)  
      1.01-2.00  Disagree   (D) 

     0.01-1.00  Strongly Disagree  (SD) 
 

The experience as qualification of local can-
didates based on the preference of the voters is 
presented in Table 2. As shown in the table, ex-
perienced elected government officials ob-
tained the highest rating which is equivalent to 
strongly agree. The results of the study indicate 
that the majority of the Filipino voters pre-
ferred the local officials who have experience in 
the government service as elected officials. 
Since the local government official is elected, 
the experience of the candidate should be 
aligned in his chosen profession. Aside from 
work experience in the government as elected 
officials, there are other qualifications which 
are preferred by the majority of the voters 
which include being a government employee 
for so long; working in the private institution 
that tied up with the government institution for 
the bid project; working in the non-govern-
mental organization.  However, the least rating 
given by the two groups of respondents is 
found in the indicator with no significant expe-
rience in government service.  

The results imply that the expected work 
experience of the local candidate is the work 
which is related to the work of the state.  

According to Lenvenshus (2021) President 
Obama was the first candidate to take full ad-
vantage and successfully use the potential of 
the Internet and his website. Obama’s website 
was interactive and allowed his constituents 
the power to navigate and gave a sense of in-
volvement. This sense of involvement is part of 
the civic participation that is required in a civic 
culture. The first 24 hours of the launching of 
Obama’s website led to the development of 
1,000 grassroots groups. The instant ability to 
create networks of support is one of the incred-
ible uses of candidate websites. These net-
works are immediately associated with the 
candidate involved, due to the creation and 
connection to the candidate’s website. Fund-
raising is also an important tool of these web-
sites. According to Pollard et al. (2019) during 
a single month in 2018, the democratic political 
candidates raised over 30 million dollars using 
online method. Fundraising efforts show the 
development of an online civic culture, in a 
world in which a recession is brewing and un-
employment is up, money is difficult to part 
with.  

 
Table 3.   Qualification of Local Candidate Based on Voters’ Preference in terms of Personality 

Legend:   
 WM -weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
 OWM - overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   

      3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree  (SA) 
      2.01-3.00  Agree   (A)  
      1.01-2.00  Disagree   (D) 

     0.01-1.00  Strongly Disagree  (SD) 
 

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  

WM VI WM VI AWM VI 
       
1. practicing traditional system of governance 3.71 SA 3.80 SA 3.76 SA 
2. popularized oneself as iron-fisted 3.77 SA 3.65 SA 3.71 SA 
3. being known as liberated 3.83 SA 3.95 SA 3.89 SA 

4. sociable and people oriented 3.41 A 3.40 A 3.41 A 
5. being known as man of action 3.74 SA 3.65 SA 3.70 SA 
OWM 3.69 SA 3.69 SA 3.69 SA 
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Table 3 revealed the perception of the ex-
pert and mainstream respondents with regards 
to the qualification of local candidates based on 
the preference of the voters in terms of person-
ality. Based on the finding, being known as lib-
erated in governing the people in the city and 
democratic approach in dealing with the peo-
ple obtained the highest rating of strongly 
agree. This shows that the respondents ob-
served the liberated mind of the local candidate 
in the heart of the public. Similarly, during the 
2008 election both Democrats and Republicans 
used Facebook to build a grassroots campaign 
to support the candidates. These sites inspired 
conversation due to large participation num-
bers on the sites. Social networking sites stim-
ulate conversation that will reach a greater 
number of people. Through these sites the can-
didate calls America’s youth to action making 
the candidate the deciding factor instead of po-
litical parties and issues. Social networking has 
made this transition to candidate-driven cam-
paigns because they reflect personal aspects of 
the candidates. President Obama’s organiza-
tion keeps his Facebook page up-to-date and 

filled with professional pictures of his day-to-
day life.  

Presidential elections are the most watched 
election in America (Hacker 2004, 11). Their 
presidential images consist of their attitudes 
and values along with a perception of leader-
ship ability. These 16 images are formed by TV 
ads, debates, websites and information found 
on social network sites. Social network sites 
distribute the candidate’s broad message to 
voters easily, as it reaches millions of people at 
once. The candidate message addresses the 
candidate’s qualifications and values to gain 
supporters. 

According to Knoll (2019) although studies 
suggest that the use of social media can pro-
mote political participation (PP), there is a lack 
of theorizing about the psychological processes 
underlying this relationship. This article at-
tempts to fill this gap by suggesting a social me-
dia political participation model. Taking a goal 
systemic perspective, the model specifies a set 
of interrelated processes that need to be real-
ized so that social media use affects the deci-
sion of voters. 

 
Table 4. Qualification of Local Candidate Based on Voters’ Preference in terms of Priority 

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  

WM VI WM VI AWM VI 
1. equal access to quality education  3.73 SA 3.80 SA 3.77 SA 

2. anti-crime and against corruption 3.79 SA 3.70 SA 3.75 SA 
3. employment and job security  3.83 SA 3.95 SA 3.89 SA 
4. economic growth and development 3.56 SA 3.35 A 3.46 A 
5. basic social services 3.74 SA 3.65 SA 3.70 SA 
OWM 3.73 SA 3.69 SA 3.71 SA 

  Legend:   
 WM -weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
 OWM - overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   

      3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree  (SA) 
      2.01-3.00  Agree    (A)  
      1.01-2.00  Disagree   (D) 

     0.01-1.00  Strongly Disagree  (SD) 
 

Table 4 reveals the results of the assess-
ment of the qualification of the local candidate 
based on the preference of the voters with re-
gards to priority. Those candidates who priori-
tize employment opportunities and security of 
tenure are highly preferred by the voters. In 
other words, those candidates who promoted 

employment as top priority in their political 
rally and campaign are highly preferred by the 
voters. Other services such as social services, 
education, anti-criminality campaigns, and eco-
nomic growth are the least priority if the candi-
date is accepted by the voters as agreed. In ad-
dition, other persuasive acts such as convincing 
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ideas about the capability of the candidate; evi-
dence of accomplishments in public service; re-
ality about the strengths and weaknesses of 
each candidate; and endorsement of trusted ce-
lebrity of popular individuals also convince the 
voters to choose that candidate. In support of 
the results of the assessment, Boulianne (2021) 
stated that the study of social media use (SMU) 
and political participation (PP) has been rap-
idly expanding. Findings suggest that the use of 
social media can promote various forms of po-
litical engagement. Despite this large body of 
research, there is a lack of theorizing about the 
psychological processes underlying this rela-
tionship. The lion’s share of research is based 
on cross-sectional studies not looking deeper 
into underlying mechanisms. The few experi-
mental studies to date have also not fully out-
lined the psychological process behind partici-
patory outcomes of social media. 

Moreover, as stated by Sihombing (2021) 
leader and leadership are one of the important 
aspects in the life of a country. This study aims 
to predict the intention of young voters to vote 
for state leader elections by expanding the the-
ory of planned behavior to the Indonesian con-
text. Apart from the importance of the presi-
dential election, research rarely uses the theory 
of planned behavior, and to the best of re-
searchers’ knowledge, there are no studies that 
have applied the theory of planned behavior to 
predict the intention to vote for the president. 
The results showed that attitude and behavior 
control were positively related to voters’ inten-
tion to elect presidential candidates. Further-
more, information from social media also has a 
positive relationship with the attitude of choos-
ing presidential candidates.  

 
Table 5. Qualification of Local Candidate Based on Voters’ Preference in terms of Education 

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  

WM VI WM VI AWM VI 
1. obtained doctorate degree 3.78 SA 3.75 SA 3.77 SA 

2. being literate individual 3.69 SA 3.70 SA 3.70 SA 
3. completed high school level 3.75 SA 3.65 SA 3.70 SA 
4. bachelor degree holder 3.72 SA 3.70 SA 3.71 SA 
5. at least graduate of vocational course 3.73 SA 3.65 SA 3.69 SA 
OWM 3.73 SA 3.69 SA 3.71 SA 

Legend:   
 WM -weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
 OWM - overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   

      3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree  (SA) 
      2.01-3.00  Agree   (A)  
      1.01-2.00  Disagree   (D) 

     0.01-1.00  Strongly Disagree  (SD) 
 

Table 5 presents the results of the assess-
ment of the qualification of the local candidate 
based on the preference of the voters with re-
gards to education. The highest educational at-
tainment of the local candidate, which is the 
doctorate degree holder, is the most preferred 
by the voters. They look up to the president 
with the highest position in the country should 
attain the highest degree in schooling in order 
to promote quality education and motivate the 
students to learn and be qualified academically 
as local government officials of the city.  

This political image is one of the most im-
portant branding tools for a campaign to de-
velop. Campaign consultant Richard Wirthin 
argues that a winning presidential candidate 
finds the weakness in his or her presidential 
image and changes the public’s perception of 
that weakness (Hacker 2004, 11). This shows 
that the candidates with the stronger image 
will more likely have the public’s support. TV, 
the Internet, blogs and social networking  
 
 



Gajudo et al., 2024 / Revisiting Qualification Standards for Local Candidates 

 

 
IJMABER  4659 Volume 5 | Number 11 | November | 2024 

 

have helped candidates form an image for the 
American voters. With this changing political 

atmosphere, the internet has brought many 
changes to political communication theories. 

 

Table 6.  Results of Testing the Significant Difference in the Assessment of the Experts and Main-
stream on the Qualification of the Local Candidate Based on the Preference of the Voters 

Level of significance – 0.05    
 

The hypothesis testing of the significant dif-
ference in the assessment of the two groups of 
respondents revealed in Table 6. As shown in 
the table, there is no significant difference in 
the assessment of the two groups of respond-
ents with regards to profession, experience, 
personality, priority, and education as voters’ 
preferred qualification of the local candidates. 
The decision is accept the null hypothesis. 
Hence, there is similarity in the response of the 
respondents of the study.  

As emphasized by Nott (2020) political ad-
vertising as a form of campaigning that allows 
candidates to directly convey their message to 
voters and influence the political debate. By 
running ads on various types of media, candi-
dates can reach audiences that otherwise may 
not have been paying attention to the election 

and build name recognition, highlight im-
portant issues, and call attention to the short-
comings of their opponents. Through political 
campaign, the qualification of the presidential 
candidate based on the perception and prefer-
ence of the voters are being highlighted.  

Voter’s background means the voter's so-
cial identity, such as economic class, ethnicity, 
gender, race and religious preference. Voters 
tend to vote for the candidate that conveys 
sameness with them (Yates, 2016; Coleman, 
2013; Locklair, 2011). This sameness can be 
based on the general background, appearance 
or even the personality of the candidate. In 
other words, voters prefer a candidate that has 
the same social identity with them (Verhulst, 
Lodge & Lavine, 2010).  

 
Table 7. Mass Media Standards for the Local Political Advertisement in terms of Content Standard 

Legend:   
 WM -weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
 OWM - overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   

Variable t-Computed t- Tabular Decision Interpretation 
1.Profession 0.477 2.776 Accept null hypothesis No significant difference 
2. Experience 0.702 2.776 Accept null hypothesis No significant difference 

3. Personality  0.018 2.776 Accept null hypothesis No significant difference 
4. Priority  0.976 2.776 Accept null hypothesis No significant difference 
5. Education 2.181 2.776 Accept null hypothesis No significant difference 

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  

WM VI WM VI AWM VI 

1. clearly illustrates his/her platforms during his/her 
campaigns. 

3.80 SA 3.75 SA 3.78 SA 

2. presents a realistic & doable project to the country, 
provinces, municipalities/cities, and barangays. 

3.70 SA 3.70 SA 3.70 SA 

3. shows a sustainable project that even the next gen-
eration can benefit. 

3.77 SA 3.80 SA 3.79 SA 

4. has a good educational background and must have 
completed at least a bachelor’s degree. 

3.74 SA 3.75 SA 3.75 SA 

5. Has a good leadership style in running the country. 3.75 SA 3.70 SA 3.73 SA 
OWM 3.75 SA 3.74 SA 3.75 SA 



Gajudo et al., 2024 / Revisiting Qualification Standards for Local Candidates 

 

    
 IJMABER 4660 Volume 5 | Number 11 | November | 2024 

 

      3.51-4.00  Strongly Agree  (SA) 
      2.51-3.50  Agree   (A)  
      1.51-2.50  Disagree  (D) 

     1.00-1.50  Strongly Disagree (SD) 
 

Table 7 revealed the result of the survey 
concerning the adherence of the political candi-
date on the content standard of the political ad-
vertisement. The results show a sustainable 
project that even the next generation can bene-
fit is considered the adherence of the right con-
tent of political ads. Other standards of the con-
tent which are compiled by the political candi-
dates include: clearly illustrates his/her plat-
forms during his/her campaigns; presents a re-
alistic & doable project to the country, prov-
inces, municipalities/cities, and barangays; has 
a good educational background and must have 
completed at least a bachelor’s degree; and has 
a good leadership style in running the country. 

Similar findings revealed in other study 
concerning the compliance to standards of 
mass media in the promotion of political cam-
paigns through advertisement. Tedesco (2022) 
stated that E-politics is the new theory that ex-
amines the potential this new media creates for 
greater interactivity between the public and 

the political sphere. This electronic political ac-
tivity allows the public to voice their opinions 
easier and allows them to meet others with 
similar opinions to band together. One group of 
researchers predicts the internet will create a 
system of “hyperpluralism” meaning too many 
special interest groups will engage in policy 
making. The internet allows interest groups to 
easily attract people to their cause creating 
support from the public and increasing their 
power to create policy in congress. The elec-
tronic political atmosphere online creates a dif-
ferent relationship between the government 
officials and their constituents. According to 
Lilleker (2020) the internet creates an influen-
tial relationship, in which the candidate is influ-
enced by their constituents and the constitu-
ents influenced by the candidate. This influence 
is created through the uses of websites, blogs, 
emails, virtual political communities and social 
media. 

 
 

Table 8. Mass Media Standards for the Local Political Advertisement in terms of Advocacy Standard 

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  

WM VI WM VI AWM VI 
1. address the real cause of poverty in every area 
in the Philippines. 

3.94 SA 3.80 SA 3.87 SA 

2. can offer the best possible solution in lifting 
the status of the marginalized sector. 

3.72 SA 3.95 SA 3.84 SA 

3. can give a real action in deterring crimes, such 
as robbery, murder, kidnapping, rape, and drugs. 

3.77 SA 3.80 SA 3.79 SA 

4. has a strong personality in ending the crimes 
yet he/she respects and values the human rights. 

3.75 SA 3.80 SA 3.78 SA 

5. promote a clean and honest government 3.78 SA 3.65 SA 3.72 SA 
OWM 3.79 SA 3.80 SA 3.80 SA 

Legend:   
 WM -weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
 OWM - overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   

      3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree  (SA) 
      2.01-3.00  Agree    (A)  
      1.01-2.00  Disagree  (D) 

     0.01-1.00  Strongly Disagree (SD) 
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Table 8 presents the adherence of the poli-
tician to the advocacy standard which is based 
on the preference of the voters. As seen in the 
table, the real cause of poverty in every area in 
the Philippines obtained the highest rating. 
This shows that the advocacy of the political 
candidates on addressing poverty in the coun-
try is the most preferred advocacy standards of 
the political campaign. Different findings re-
vealed in the reviewed study. Boulianne (2021) 
stated that the study of social media use (SMU) 
and political participation (PP) has been rap-
idly expanding. Findings suggest that the use of 
social media can promote various forms of po-
litical engagement. Despite this large body of 
research, there is a lack of theorizing about the 
psychological processes underlying this rela-
tionship. The lion’s share of research is based 
on cross-sectional studies not looking deeper 
into underlying mechanisms. The few experi-
mental studies to date have also not fully out-
lined the psychological process behind partici-
patory outcomes of social media. 

Moreover, as stated by Sihombing (2021) 
leader and leadership are one of the important 
aspects in the life of a country. This study aims 
to predict the intention of young voters to vote 
for state leader elections by expanding the the-
ory of planned behavior to the Indonesian con-
text. Apart from the importance of the presi-
dential election, research rarely uses the theory 
of planned behavior, and to the best of re-
searchers’ knowledge, there are no studies that 
have applied the theory of planned behavior to 
predict the intention to vote for the president. 
The results showed that attitude and behavior 
control were positively related to voters’ inten-
tion to elect presidential candidates. Further-
more, information from social media also has a 
positive relationship with the attitude of choos-
ing presidential candidates. However, the re-
sults also show that subjective norms do not 
have a significant relationship with voters’ in-
tention.  

 
  

 
Table 9. Mass Media Standards for the Local Political Advertisement in terms of Professional Stand-

ard 

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  

WM VI WM VI AWM VI 
1. endorsed by any celebrity or even by seasoned 
politicians. 

3.30 A 3.60 SA 3.45 A 

2. pro-people and has made a contribution to help 
the victims, esp. victims of natural disasters. 

3.58 SA 3.55 SA 3.57 SA 

3. loves his/her nation as he/she loves the people 3.78 SA 3.70 SA 3.74 SA 

4. has the capability to lead a clean and honest gov-
ernment. 

3.75 SA 3.60 SA 3.68 SA 

5. has the best decision to run the country without 
being influenced by some opportunistic individuals. 

3.66 SA 3.35 A 3.51 SA 

OWM 3.61 SA 3.56 SA 3.59 SA 

Legend:   
 WM -weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
 OWM - overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   

      3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree  (SA) 
      2.01-3.00  Agree   (A)  
      1.01-2.00  Disagree   (D) 

     0.01-1.00  Strongly Disagree  (SD) 
 

Table 9 demonstrates the assessment of the 
respondents with regards to the professional 
standards upheld by the local candidates in 
their political ads. The love of his/her nation as 

he/she loves the people is the highest standard 
that is attained by the politician. As profession-
als, the politician should care about the people 
and love for the nation in order to convince the 
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public. In the article of Yan (2022), the re-
sponses of social media users to politicians' dif-
ferent content strategies have tremendous im-
plications for election campaigns. However, the 
identification of the factors that influence social 
media users' responses remains a challenge. In 
this paper, we combine partial least squares 
(PLS) with a cross-validation technique to au-
tomatically identify the type of social media 
posts that are associated with strong responses 
from social media users. This approach is dif-
ferent from other methods that require manual 
identification of these associations. The results 
show that the dominant candidate used his 
strong position to construct a strong online im-
age, with posts generating more and longer 
comments and thus yielding more positive 
feedback. While media frames do not have any 
impact on either affective responses or the 

quality of comments, the use of videos and pho-
tographs elicits more responses. 

Moreover, Vaccari (2021) stated that schol-
ars and commentators have debated whether 
lower-threshold forms of political engagement 
on social media should be treated as being con-
ducive to higher-threshold modes of political 
participation or a diversion from them. Draw-
ing on an original survey of a representative 
sample of Italians who discussed the 2013 elec-
tion on Twitter, we demonstrate that the more 
respondents acquire political information via 
social media and express themselves politically 
on these platforms, the more they are likely to 
contact politicians via e-mail, campaign for par-
ties and candidates using social media, and at-
tend offline events to which they were invited 
online.  

 
Table 10. Mass Media Standards for the Local Political Advertisement in terms of Ethical Standard 

Indicators 
Experts Mainstream  
WM VI WM VI AWM VI 

1. eloquence in public speaking and direct to the 
point. 

3.77 SA 3.75 SA 3.76 SA 

2. usage of appropriate terms and acceptable to the 
public. 

3.69 SA 3.45 A 3.57 SA 

3. an education of the public on the importance of 
their votes 

3.84 SA 3.65 SA 3.75 SA 

4. a transparent presentation of oneself, including 
his/her sources of funds and wealth. 

3.79 SA 3.75 SA 3.77 SA 

5. eliminate criticism and character assassination of 
his/her political rivals. 

3.80 SA 3.70 SA 3.75 SA 

OWM 3.78 SA 3.66 SA 3.72 SA 
Legend:   
 WM -weighted mean  VI-verbal interpretation 
 OWM - overall weighted mean  AWM- Average Weighted Mean   

      3.01-4.00  Strongly Agree  (SA) 
      2.01-3.00  Agree   (A)  
      1.01-2.00  Disagree   (D) 

     0.01-1.00  Strongly Disagree  (SD) 
 

Table 10 presents the result of the study 
concerning the ethical standard promoted by 
the political ads of the local candidate. As 
shown in the table, the ethical standard which 
is upheld by the politician on their political ads 
is the transparent presentation of oneself, in-
cluding his/her sources of funds and wealth. 
The transparency is considered the highest  

ethical standards in political advertisement. In 
the work of Koppang (2019) another social po-
litical site is techpresident.com, a news and 
conversation political site (“About Personal De-
mocracy Media”). The goal of this site is to act 
as a hub between technology and politics; 
TechPresident holds conferences all over the 
world and teleconferences over the websites 
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for political and democratic forums (“About 
Personal Democracy Media”). These are two of 
the many political sites that create a political 
community to debate and share ideas about 
politics. Political campaigning, regardless of 
whether it is online, still uses the same political 
campaign concepts of propaganda, persuasion 
and grassroots campaigning. Propaganda is the 
organized mass communication, resulting from 
a hidden agenda to conform belief and action 
by manipulating mechanisms.  

Lin (2019) stated that propaganda is used 
for political campaigns and by the government 
to persuade the public to believe what they 

want them to believe, whether it is targeted to 
gather votes for a candidate or to gather sup-
port for other policies. These messages demon-
strate the power of mass political communica-
tion to sway public opinion. They spread their 
message through the mainstream media, and 
campaign materials like pamphlets, commer-
cials, debates and speeches. Political campaigns 
can use social media as another outlet to spread 
their propaganda, however in a political cam-
paign the goal is not so hidden from the public. 
The message is crafted to spin each candidate 
in the best light, developed to persuade constit-
uents.  

 
Table 11.  Results of Testing the Significant Difference in the Assessment of the Experts and Main-

stream on the Mass Media Standards for the Local Political Advertisement 

Variable t-Computed t- Tabular Decision Interpretation 
     
1. Content 0.703 2.776 Accept null hypothesis No significant difference 

2. Advocacy 0.073 2.776 Accept null hypothesis No significant difference 
3. Professional 0.565 2.776 Accept null hypothesis No significant difference 
4. Ethical 3.373 2.776 Reject null hypothesis With significant difference 

Level of significance – 0.05    
  

Table 11 reveals the results of hypothesis 
testing in the assessment of the respondents on 
the mass media standards for the political ad-
vertisements of the local candidate.  As shown 
in the table, there is similarity in the assess-
ment of the respondents with regards to con-
tent, advocacy and professional standards. 
However, the significant difference in the as-
sessment of the two groups of respondents re-
vealed in the analysis of ethical standards. The 
results imply that ethical standard and prefer-
ence of the respondents varies hence objective 
ethical is hardly to attain. This political image is 
one of the most important branding tools for a 
campaign to develop. Campaign consultant 
Richard Wirthin argues that a winning presi-
dential candidate finds the weakness in his or 
her presidential image and changes the public’s 
perception of that weakness (Hacker 2004, 11). 
This shows that the candidates with the 
stronger image will more likely have the pub-
lic’s support. TV, the Internet, blogs and social 
networking have helped candidates form an 
image for the American voters. With this chang-
ing political atmosphere, the internet has 

brought many changes to political communica-
tion theories. 

Moreover, According to Lilleker (2020) the 
internet creates an influential relationship, in 
which the candidate is influenced by their con-
stituents and the constituents influenced by the 
candidate. This influence is created through the 
use of websites, blogs, emails, virtual political 
communities and social media as previously 
discussed, creating a one-on-one discussion of 
the issues and candidates. This is the main dif-
ference and use of the e-political atmosphere, 
instead of radio and TV’s shouting persuasive 
statements at their audience; the Internet cre-
ates a dialogue and a greater democratic at-
mosphere. While this has changed the political 
atmosphere, TV and internet have prompted a 
sound bite culture that has changed the way 
politics works. A sound bite is a sentence or 
even just a few words from a speech or inter-
view that can show a position of a larger issue. 

Moreover, it is found that individuals with 
higher education participate to a larger extent 
in political activities than individuals with less 
education. Hence, education increases skills 
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and knowledge which might also affect political 
interest and efficacy; factors that are all im-
portant to see in a candidate. Personality of the 
presidential candidate trails behind, ranking 

third, while the candidate’s platform/priority 
was ranked fourth in millennials’ preferences, 
(Hayes, 2010).  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Figure 2. Rank of political ads directly affects the ideology and decision of Voters 
 

Figure 2 reveals the ranking of the aspects 
of social media political ads that affect the ide-
ology and decision of voters in local candidates. 
Based on the scores given by the experts and 
mainstream respondents, the study revealed 
that fame is ranked number 1 by political ex-
perts and the voters from the mainstream. The 
second in rank is the endorsement of celebri-
ties. This shows that the primary purpose of the 
political ads is the promotion of local candi-
dates to become famous to the voters. Moreo-
ver, the third in rank for the experts is the po-
litical party while the mainstream respondents 
rank political platform as third in rank. In addi-
tion, the respondents rank the character or per-
sonality of the local candidate as the lowest 
since it is not fully observed or seen in the po-
litical advertisements posted in the social me-
dia.  

The results imply that popularity is a great 
factor that influences the voters. The main-
stream respondents based their decision only 
on the fame of the local candidates. They be-
come famous due to endorsement of known ce-
lebrities. The Filipinos are dependent on the 
level of fame of the political candidate as fed by 
the media since they don’t have any other 

source of knowledge concerning the achieve-
ments and character of the presidential candi-
dates. Thus, appealing to popularity is highly 
utilized by the local candidate in order to influ-
ence the voters to choose them.   

In support, Nott (2020) emphasized that by 
running ads on various types of media, candi-
dates can reach audiences that otherwise may 
not have been paying attention to the election 
and build name recognition, highlight im-
portant issues, and call attention to the short-
comings of their opponents. Thus, social media 
reaches the public in order to promote the po-
litical candidates which make them popular 
and famous among the mainstream. In addi-
tion, Vonderschmitt (2021) emphasized that a 
political campaign is carefully crafted for each 
candidate, to address their constituency and 
present the candidate and party in the best pos-
sible way. This advance in technology has cre-
ated more opportunity for citizens to partici-
pate, as they learn more about each candidate 
and have easier access to the candidates them-
selves. The instant ability to create networks of 
support is one of the incredible uses of candi-
date websites.  
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Figure 3. Ranking of qualifications of the local candidates  
 
Figure 3 demonstrates the ranking of the 

qualification of the local candidate which is 
promoted in the political ads that influence the 
preference of the voters from the mainstream. 
As presented in the figure, the expert in politi-
cal affairs considered charism as rank number 
1, as obtained the highest score.  On the part of 
voters from the streamline, the highest score 
obtained in media popularity. This means that 
the streamline respondents considered media 
popularity as rank number 1. The findings im-
ply that the media popularity and charism di-
rectly affect the decision of the voters to choose 
their candidates. Therefore, the decision of the 
respondents to choose their preferred local 
candidate is highly affected by the charism of 
the candidate as they frequently appeared in 
the social media which increased their popular-
ity.  

On the other hand, the experts and voters 
from the mainstream also considered other fac-
tors affecting their decision and ideology in 
choosing the local candidate as reflected on the 
political ads such as political will as third in 
rank. Moreover, the fourth and fifth rank of the 
factors based on the scores given by the re-
spondents includes the prominence and  

democratic principles. This further shows that 
principle, advocacy, and personality of the local 
candidates have lesser effect on the decision of 
the voters. Since the popularity of the local can-
didate is more important considerations of the 
voters compared to the personality and capa-
bility of the local candidates, as projected in the 
political advertisements the political aspirants 
should utilize the mass media in reaching the 
mainstream to choose them. With regards to 
the promotion of qualification of the political 
aspirants, according to Pollard et al. (2019) 
Candidates use social networking tools, Face-
book and Twitter, to reach America's youth. 
They used Facebook to build a grassroots cam-
paign to support the candidates. These sites in-
spired conversation due to large participation 
numbers on the sites. Social networking sites 
stimulate conversation that will reach a greater 
number of people. Through these sites the can-
didate calls America’s youth to action making 
the candidate the deciding factor instead of po-
litical parties and issues. Social networking has 
made this transition to candidate-driven cam-
paigns because they reflect personal aspects of 
the candidates.  
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Figure 4. Ranking of Political strategies of local candidates during election 
 

Figure 4 presents a ranking of political 
strategies of the supporters of the local candi-
dates. As shown in figure the expert and main-
stream respondents rank number 1 the utiliza-
tion of social media for the propaganda move-
ment of the local candidates. This is the political 
ads from both television and social media plat-
forms that use to destabilize their opponents 
and demoralize the public. The second to the 
highest rank is the failed promises of the local 
candidates which are reflected and presented 
in the political advertisement.  In addition, the 
third in rank is the vote buying activities which 
are rampant in most places in the country as re-
ported in the news. Some reports presented in 
the social media, there activities which are 
filmed that purok leaders and coordinators 
who will then distribute the money with sam-
ple ballots. Furthermore, the fourth in rank is 
the campaign sabotage. And the last in rank is 
the political sabotage on the campaign strate-
gies of rival politicians.  Usually, character as-
sassination is the usual strategy in campaign 
activities.  

In the practice of new media utilization on 
the promotion of local candidates, the local 
elections are the most watched election in 
America (Hacker 2004, 11). Their local images 

consist of their attitudes and values along with 
a perception of leadership ability. These 16 im-
ages are formed by TV ads, debates, websites 
and information found on social network sites. 
Social network sites distribute the candidate’s 
broad message to voters easily, as it reaches 
millions of people at once. The candidate mes-
sage addresses the candidate’s qualifications 
and values to gain supporters. I9i9Moreover, 
the new media is utilized in communication of 
any information including the promotion of the 
local candidate and other politicians. Tedesco 
(2022) stated that E-politics is the new theory 
that examines the potential this new media cre-
ates for greater interactivity between the pub-
lic and the political sphere. This electronic po-
litical activity allows the public to voice their 
opinions easier and allows them to meet others 
with similar opinions to band together. Accord-
ing to Lilleker (2020) the internet creates an in-
fluential relationship, in which the candidate is 
influenced by their constituents and the con-
stituents influenced by the candidate. This in-
fluence is created through the use of websites, 
blogs, emails, virtual political communities and 
social media as previously discussed, creating a 
one-on-one discussion of the issues.  
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Redefining Filipino Media Campaign Program 

Component 
Program 

Specific 
Objectives 

Implementation 
Activities 

Responsible 
Person 

Time 
Frame 

Target 
Output 

 
New Media 
Awareness 
and Literacy 
Program 
 

To increase the 
level of aware-
ness of the pub-
lic on the influ-
ence of the new 
media 
 
 
To develop liter-
acy among vot-
ers on the ad-
vantages and 
disadvantages of 
social media in 
promotional 
campaign of po-
litical candidates 

Create educational 
videos to be shared 
online concerning 
the social media 
promotions and its 
influence to the 
public. 
 
Conduct community 
orientation pro-
gram for voter’s ed-
ucation on respon-
sible voting 

COMELEC 
Commissioner 

Annual 
activity 

Well Edu-
cated Voters 

Mass Media 
Standard Ad-
herence Pro-
gram 

To increase the 
level of adher-
ence of the polit-
ical parties to 
the standard in 
the creation of 
political adver-
tisement 
 
To develop 
transparency 
and honest 
among political 
candidates 
 
 

1. Implement 
strictly the stand-
ards in evaluating 
the contents of the 
political ads prior 
sharing in new me-
dia 
 
 
2. Provide feedback 
to political ads crea-
tor to improve its 
contents 

Social Media 
Administra-
tors 

Campaign 
period 

Organized 
Political Ad-
vertisement 

 
Political Cam-
paign 
Promotion 
Program 

To increase the 
level of utiliza-
tion of the new 
media in en-
hancing popular-
ity of local candi-
date 
 
To maximize the 
utilization of me-
dia for political 
ads instead 
printed adver-
tisement 

1. Encourage the 
politicians to create 
competitive ads 
that promote popu-
larity of the politi-
cian 
 
2. Create standard-
ized fee for the new 
media for political 
advertisement to 
minimize and grad-
ually eradicate the 
printed ads. 

Broadcasting 
Company 

Campaign 
Period 

New Media 
Political Ad-
vertisement 
of Local Can-
didate 
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Conclusions 
The voters' preferences for local candidates 

highlight specific qualifications that include be-
ing a popular celebrity, experienced elected of-
ficials, a liberated personality, prioritizing job 
opportunities and job security in their pro-
grams, and holding a doctorate degree as the 
highest educational attainment. Respondents 
share a consistent perception of these qualifi-
cation standards, and the political ads of local 
candidates align with mass media standards, 
particularly in content, advocacy, professional, 
and ethical areas. This alignment is evident in 
the clear presentation of political platforms of-
fering concrete solutions to poverty, contribu-
tions to disaster victims, and the avoidance of 
character attacks against rivals. While there is 
general agreement on adherence to standards 
in new media, perceptions of ethical standards 
vary based on individual moral contexts. Nota-
bly, fame and celebrity endorsements signifi-
cantly influence voter ideologies and decisions, 
with the charisma and popularity of candidates 
being highly preferred attributes, as political 
ads often focus on promoting candidates' pop-
ularity. During campaign periods, local candi-
dates frequently employ new media strategies 
to undermine their opponents and sway public 
sentiment. Consequently, a proposed political 
advocacy program aims to enhance voter 

awareness and education, emphasizing the 
need for candidates to possess liberated mind-
sets, relevant degrees, and a clear vision to ad-
dress pressing issues. This program should also 
stress adherence to new media standards, in-
cluding the clear illustration of political plat-
forms, concrete solutions for poverty, and a 
pro-people approach. 

Local aspirants are encouraged to begin 
their political careers by running for lower na-
tional positions and leveraging social media for 
visibility while promoting employment oppor-
tunities throughout their campaigns. To en-
hance their qualifications and confidence, they 
should pursue higher academic degrees and in-
corporate concrete solutions in their political 
ads to address socio-economic issues, particu-
larly for marginalized groups. Political adver-
tisements should feature realistic portrayals of 
the candidates' regular activities to build public 
trust and demonstrate sincerity in their advo-
cacy. Ad creators are advised to conduct quick 
surveys to gauge the impact of their ads and to 
produce a series of them that effectively com-
municate a cohesive narrative. Additionally, 
these ads must adhere to established content 
standards in style, background, sound, and dia-
logue, and emphasize the public's role in sup-
porting government initiatives to alleviate pov-
erty. Furthermore, the content should focus on 

Component 
Program 

Specific 
Objectives 

Implementation 
Activities 

Responsible 
Person 

Time 
Frame 

Target 
Output 

 
Digital Ethics 
Development 
Program 
 
 
 

To promote 
equality and 
honesty in the 
promotion of lo-
cal candidate us-
ing political ad-
vertisement 
 
 
To discourage 
the local candi-
date to practice 
the traditional 
political strate-
gies 
 

1. Implement 
strictly the ethical 
standards in the 
contents of the po-
litical ads in order 
to ensure a clean 
and honest promo-
tion of local candi-
dates 
2. Non posting of 
political ads which 
do not pass the min-
imum requirement 
for ethical and pro-
fessional standards 
of Mass Media Pro-
motion 

Social Media 
Administra-

tors 
Annual 

Professional 
and ethical 
campaign 
strategies 
using politi-
cal ads 
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long-term, expertise-based programs rather 
than temporary solutions, while ethical com-
mittees in mass media must ensure that the ad-
vertisements are properly edited to prevent 
any potential harm to the public. 
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