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ABSTRACT 

 

Work-life balance is a cycle of one's life experiences which means satis-

faction with work, family, and self. The study explored the self-repre-

sentation of married female teachers with their work-life balance in 

Philippine public schools during pandemics through qualitative re-

search using metaphorical analysis. The participants' metaphors of 

their work-life balance were identified in the interview, such as being 

like a drained cellphone, melting candle, strong and big tree, spider, 

COVID-19 vaccine, and season. Also, several studies revealed that they 

juggle multiple roles during pre-pandemic. Hence, their experiences in 

terms of work-life balance have advantages and disadvantages during 

the pandemic, which may worsen or lighten the current roles they have. 

Thus, it is recommended to raise more awareness of women's work-life 

balance in their organizations or agencies. Also, strengthening Republic 

Act 9710 in the workplace is highly recommended. 
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Introduction 
Men and women in this generation are both 

responsible for making a living, which makes 
work-life balance an important issue. The idea 
of work-life balance helps employees figure out 
how to divide their time. They spend a lot of 
time and energy on work, family, and other im-
portant things in their lives. Work-life balance 
is how an employee feels about how their per-
sonal time, family responsibilities, and work all 
fit together with as little conflict as possible 
(Clark, 2000; Ungerson and Yeandle, 2005). 

Work-life balance also just means where an 
employee draws the line between paid work 
and unpaid work. Clark (2000) says that work-
life balance means "satisfaction and good func-
tioning at work and at home with as little role 
conflict as possible." 

In the past few years, Filipino women have 
had to stay at home and take care of their fami-
lies. If they wanted to go to school, they had to 
depend on their fathers. Few people have the 
chance to go to school and choose their own ca-
reers. These were rules about women that  
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society had made up. But as the knowledge 
economy grew and educational rights changed 
quickly, women were given the chance to go to 
school and continue to grow to their fullest po-
tential by having careers and professions. Now, 
there are enough women in the work force to 
make a difference (Anna, B., 2010). Barik 
(2017) says that teaching is a job that requires 
a lot of patience and empathy. Since females are 
thought to be more caring and empathetic, 
schools are a good place for them to get a job 
and feel welcome. This job also requires them 
to stay up-to-date because they have to enrich 
the next generation. 

But this is hard for women because they 
have to do a lot of things at home and at work. 
When working women get married, they have 
more responsibilities, and when they have chil-
dren, they have to take care of them and their 
extended family. Because of this, they are under 
more pressure to keep their careers going (De-
lina & Raya, 2013). There are a lot of tasks and 
responsibilities that come with being a teacher, 
some of which can be hard. People who work as 
teachers often have more trouble balancing 
their work and personal lives than people in 
other jobs. This is because teachers' jobs are of-
ten stressful, making it hard for them to meet 
their other social and family obligations (Mer-
cado, 2019). 

During the pandemic, teachers were said to 
be busier than they were before the schools 
closed because they were expected to be pre-
sent and available. For example, they had office 
hours during lunch, and groups of students 
came and went throughout the day (Jones & 
Kessler, 2020). The new trend, which kept 
teachers busy, was to change face-to-face clas-
ses into asynchronous and synchronous ses-
sions, prepare e-learning materials, and do 
other things like that. Also, the COVID-19 pan-
demic is having a big impact on the way teach-
ers live (Rabacal et al., 2020). In addition to the 
possible stress caused by the threat of COVID-
19 to themselves and their families, teachers 
also have to adjust to the new normal in educa-
tion and provide effective remedial education 
(Guillasper et al., 2020; Moralista & Oducado, 
2020). So, even though there are more studies 
on the work-life balance of female teachers be-
fore the pandemic, there isn't much written 

about their work-life balance during the pan-
demic. This could help agencies figure out how 
to make women more productive in the work-
place. Also, since women make up half of the 
world's workforce, it's important to know how 
female teachers balance work, family, and the 
pandemic. So, this study looked at what mar-
ried teachers in public schools in the Philip-
pines went through during the COVID-19 pan-
demic. In particular, it looked at the balance be-
tween self, family, and work. 

 
Methods 
Design 

Qualitative phenomenological analysis was 
used by the researchers to gather descriptive 
data from the people's own words and actions 
(Taylor, Bogdan & DeVault 2015). When it 
comes to qualitative research, the phenomenol-
ogy approach focuses on what experiences peo-
ple in a certain group have in common. The 
main goal of this method is to come up with a 
description of the nature of the group and phe-
nomenon in question. Interviews are usually 
done with a group of people who know 
firsthand about an event, situation, or experi-
ence. 

(Moustakas, 1994) The interview tries to 
answer two big questions: What have you seen 
or heard about the phenomenon? What kinds of 
situations or places do people usually find 
themselves in when they experience the phe-
nomenon? (Creswell, 2013). Through this pro-
cess, the researcher may be able to figure out 
what the event, situation, or experience means 
in a broader sense and gain a deeper under-
standing of it. 
 
Data Collection Tools 

Data was gathered using a structured form 
created by researchers and edited by the opin-
ions of two domain experts to create the final 
form. The interview form consisted of two 
parts; Part A looked into the socio-demo-
graphic profile of the respondents. While Part 
B was open-ended questions about the lived ex-
periences of married female teachers during 
the pandemic in terms of self, life and work sat-
isfaction. They were asked for metaphors for 
their self-representation during pandemics 
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based on their experiences. The data were col-
lected through face to face and video call inter-
views. The interview process was recorded in 
audio format with the consent of the partici-
pants. The participants were chosen based on 
the following criteria: (1) Married Female 
Teacher, (2) Havıng one or more children, (3) 
Both are working in Public Schools. 

 
Analysis of Data 

Metaphorical analysis was used to look at 
the participants' real-life experiences. It is a 
method of discourse analysis that is largely 
based on the work of Lakoff and Johnson 
(1980), who looked at how metaphors affect 
how people think. The idea behind this method 
is that by looking at the metaphors people use 
to talk about their experiences and beliefs, they 
can start to find the direct and conscious mean-
ings that the writer or speaker is trying to get 
across (Zheng & Song, 2010). The fact that 
there are so many metaphors for the qualita-
tive research process shows that reducing it to 
just one metaphor is a forced simplification 
(Schmitt, 2015). 

Moser (2000) said that metaphor analysis 
is a good way to find out about "social and cul-
tural processes of understanding" and to get at 
knowledge that isn't obvious (p. 5). While 
Bullough and Gitlin (1995) talked about the 
power of metaphor analysis to show how as-
sumptions "define a concept and drive action" 
(Bullough, 1991, p. 51). The study of metaphor 
is now recognized as a valid alternative to tra-
ditional and conservative ways of looking at 
how people think (Zheng & Song, 2010). Also, 
Cameron (2007:200) says that metaphor is 
seen as a tool for language, thinking, feeling, 
and socializing. It is cognitive because each 
metaphor can be a reflection of larger meta-
phorical structures in which larger domains are 
mapped onto each other (Lakoff, 1993). So, the 
basic information that metaphors can use 
comes from language. Discourse analysts are 
metaphors in the words of discourse partici-
pants, and metaphors can be used in many dif-
ferent ways. The goal of the researcher is to 
show how powerful metaphorical language is 
by giving the participants ways to talk about 
themselves based on what they learned during 
the pandemic. 

 
Findings 
Socio-demographic Profile of the Partici-
pants 

This part of the paper will present the re-
sults and discussion of the study using meta-
phorical analysis on the participants' re-
sponses.  The first is the socio-demographic 
profile of the participants. Twelve (12) married 
female teachers were interviewed from differ-
ent public schools in the Philippines. It was re-
vealed that participants have an average age of 
30-40 years old; 90% of them attained gradu-
ate studies; all are designated into various 
school designations. Further, they earn an av-
erage of P10,000.00-50,000.00 from their job; 
they obtained an average of 7-10 years in the 
service. Participants were teaching in elemen-
tary and secondary schools in the Province of 
Masbate. In terms of the number of children, 
they have an average of 2-4 children. Also, they 
are married for an average of 3-10 years. 

 
Metaphors of Work-life Balance of Married 
Female Techers during Pandemic 

The second part of the results and discus-
sion is exploring the work-life balance of the 
participants in terms of family, work and self.  
All of the eight (8) respondents spoke meta-
phorically to describe themselves and their 
work-balance during pandemic. They find easy 
to express when they compare themselves into 
something that represents their feelings and 
experiences. Metaphors give them absolute 
idea of who they are, and their aspirations of 
satisfying life of a working woman. 

 
Extract 1 

When asked about how they would de-
scribe themselves during pandemic the follow-
ing are their responses: 

 
Participant 1: “I see myself as a drained cell-
phone which can be charged during pandemic”. 

With the response given by the participant 
it can be noted that there is a positive perspec-
tive of her situation during pandemic. Since hu-
man body after being exposed to work recharg-
ing it will gain energy to work on what is ex-
pected of it, however as the interview went by, 
she claimed that she is like a cellphone because 
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she felt that she maximized all her energy doing 
household chores and working late nights to 
finish her reports until she is totally drained. 
Also, she expresses that if given a chance to ad-
vice her younger self she would say that finish-
ing her graduate studies in early adulthood 
stage will help her balance her responsibilities 
at home and at work.  

 
Participant 4: “I feel like, I am candle during 
pandemic”. 

Just like the idea of a candle, it has to melt 
to give light to a dark corner. This participant 
compared herself to being a candle for her fam-
ily during pandemic. Despite of the multiple 
roles she performed in the house and at work, 
she managed to save time and energy for her 
children who are seeking attention since they 
are still young. She would sometimes feel lost 
because of the feeling of anxiety of might cac-
thing a virus but she chose to be strong for her 
children since her husband is also busy at work 
and spends less time for their children. Further, 
she claims “ I have no time to take care of my-
self anymore”. Late nights give her time to re-
flect of her dreams for her children and family. 
She is like melting a candle yet getting brighter 
for the sake of her children. Thus, she added 
that there is no sufficient time for herself mak-
ing her work-life unbalanced, however despite 
of this situation she still hopes that her life will 
be full of happiness someday because of the 
sacrifices she made for her family and children. 

 
Participant 6: “I am like a tree during pan-
demic.” 

A big and strong tree is the self-representa-
tion of the fourth participant. With the thought 
that everyone is hit by this pandemic, this par-
ticipant claimed that she is like a tree still 
standing strong despite of losing a loved one. 
She expressed that wherever the wind goes she 
will always remain standing, her leaves may 
wither and die, but she believes that another 
set of leaves will come out again more greener 
and healthier. Thus, her work-life balance dur-
ing pandemic may be winding, she has ups and 
downs, unmet deadlines but she has still posi-
tive perspective in life that she will get up and 
bloom again just like a strong and big tree.  

 

Participant 5: “I am a like a vaccine family dur-
ing pandemic.” 

This participant claimed that she is like a 
COVID-19 vaccine because even people know 
that it is important to be vaccinated others 
could not appreciate its usefulness in saving 
lives. According to her, no matter how big her 
efforts exerted in the workplace and family she 
is still not appreciated. She would feel drained 
and exhausted because of the workload added 
to the teachers during pandemic, also, she has 
to deal with her growing children doing online 
classes and modules, and her husband who suf-
fers from depression and anxiety. For her pan-
demic brought big changes in her family life 
even how she talks to her children, she is a lot 
more of authoritative rather than friendly un-
like during pre-pandemic. When she was asked 
of what advice she could give to her younger 
self she said that she has to prioritize her 
dreams and goals rather than having a boy-
friend and get married after college graduation. 
She should spend more time exploring and 
equipping herself to become the woman she 
wanted to be. 

 
Extract 2 

Participants were asked to describe their 
work-life balance during pandemic they an-
swered metaphorically. 

 
Participant 2: “I think, my work-life balance in 
this time of pandemic is like sailing on differen 
kinds of weather.”  

This participant compared sailing into 
dancing. She stated that regardless of the situa-
tions she is facing, this pandemic taught her to 
go (dance) with the flow, to the ifs and hows of 
life. She also claimed that the pandemic taught 
her the importance of quality time with the 
family since she availed of a work from home 
scheme from her school assignment. She sees 
to it that she manages their household chores 
effeciently with the help of her husband. She is 
actually thankful of the positive impacts of pan-
demic since she can now assist and bond with 
her children while answering to their modules. 

  
Participant 3: “My work-life balance is like the 
season, its a cycle.” 
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According to this participant her work-life 
balance is constantly changing because of the 
unpredictable workload added to her as a 
teacher which is sometimes so exhausting that 
may led her to burnout. One good thing is that 
she has her child who inspire her to keep going 
despite of the uncertainties brought by the pan-
demic. 

 
Participant 8: “I am like a spider because of the 
work and life I have right now”. 

She said that she is like a spider because of 
the many hands and feet of the spider. Having 
multiple roles such as; productive, reproduc-
tive and community roles, participant 8 
claimed that she experiences multiple burden. 
Multiple burden is a manifestation of gender 
bias which led to violence agaisnt women and 
children. She deeply expresses her tiredness on 
her duty as a wife, mother and a teacher, how-
ever, this tiredness also gives her reason to still 
fight for her children’s future. Positive perspec-
tive can be seen in her eyes after a tearful ex-
pression of her deep emotions.  

 
Results, Discussion, and Recommenda-
tions 

Along with their socio-demographic infor-
mation, the participants have different socio-
demographic information. This means that 
married female teachers come from different 
backgrounds. Tusal (2017) says that the factors 
that affect employee burnout are demographic 
variables like age, gender, marital status, and 
education, personality traits, and work-related 
behavior patterns. In some studies, the burnout 
level of women has been found to be high, while 
in other studies, the burnout level of men has 
been found to be high. There have also been 
nondifferential studies. This means that the 
many jobs that married female teachers had to 
do for their families made them tired and un-
happy with their lives. With a pandemic 
around, the anxiety it brings may make the sit-
uation of the people worse than it was before 
the pandemic. Also, major factors are known to 
play a role, as are the person's geographical lo-
cation and race (Noronha & Aithal, 2019). Also, 
Bharadwaj and Shanker (2019) say that per-
sonal and family-related factors like age, gen-
der, marital status, family or childcare  

responsibilities, and personality concerns all 
play a role in making it hard to balance work 
and life. 

The second part of the paper is a collection 
of metaphors about how the participants bal-
ance work and life. Literature shows that there 
are words for work-life balance that have to do 
with family, self, and work. People who took 
part in this paper wrote about how they bal-
ance their work and personal lives. In inter-
views or focus groups, researchers might use 
elicitation or a "forced metaphor approach" 
(Tracy, 2010), in which they ask people to use 
metaphors to describe their experiences. Then, 
researchers could look at how people in a cer-
tain community made sense of similar experi-
ences by comparing the types of metaphors 
they used. Also, asking people to compare their 
own lives to metaphors can get them to think 
critically and evaluate, and it can give research-
ers interesting comparisons to look at (Redden, 
2017). The results of this study show that the 
different situations that married working 
women face during a pandemic had a big effect 
on how they felt during the pandemic. The re-
searcher found that most of the 8 respondents 
used metaphors when talking about them-
selves. 

By thinking of herself as a dead phone that 
can be charged again, she acknowledges that 
she is too tired to work and take care of her 
house, but she still manages to keep going with 
her life. This is similar to a study done by Barik 
(2017), which found that both in public and pri-
vate schools, married female teachers are un-
happy with their work-life balance, but they 
still work hard to make it work. In the findings, 
a melting candle is used as a metaphor for a 
woman who gives up herself for her family. The 
more she lights up and melts, the more she is 
happy with her work-life balance. This fits with 
what Carli's (2010) study found: "Women give 
up free time and sleep to meet the needs of 
their families and jobs." But Krymis (2011) said 
that having more than one job is good for both 
work and family. One of the participants also 
mentioned a spider, which shows that the 
women played more than one role during the 
pandemic. Broadbridge (2009) found that 
women had too many responsibilities and 
made more sacrifices for their children than 
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men did. Being a big, strong tree is like being a 
candle that is melting, which was what another 
participant said. She said that despite the prob-
lems caused by the pandemic, women tend to 
look at the bright side and try to move on. To 
back up these findings, Thein, Currie, Austen, 
and Ong (2016) said that even though work can 
be stressful, women choose to keep working in 

order to support their families financially and 
find their own sense of identity. They may find 
it hard to be a mother, a wife, and a career 
woman at the same time. Yet, this is proven by 
the thousands of stories of women leaders who 
are able to handle both home and work respon-
sibilities (Cabrera et al., 2019).

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Diagram 1. Metaphors of Work-Life Balance of Female Married Teachers During Pandemic 
 

A participant also made a comparison to a 
COVID-19 vaccine, which shows that no matter 
how important it is, it is still taken for granted 
and needs are not met. The problem for mar-
ried women, according to a study by Cabrera 
(2019), is that they have less time to do their 
hobbies, hang out with friends, and do other re-
laxing things. Also, studies have shown that 
women who work for money and have young 
children are most likely to say they don't have 
time for themselves (Roberts, 2007). Also, in 
Garcia's (2016) study, the people he talked to 
about how hard it was to balance work and 
family responsibilities said that it was hard to 
find time for them. 

So, people who work in Human Resource 
Management and Industrial or Organizational 
Psychology can come up with and put into place 
programs and systems that promote high-qual-
ity and effective WLB in institutions and agen-
cies where working women or mothers belong 
(Cabrera et al., 2019). Also, family-friendly pol-
icies show that you care about the well-being of 
your employees and could help you get their 
commitment. An institution should take the  

initiative to implement work-life balance poli-
cies and practices like flexible hours, childcare 
centers, rest rooms to take a nap, and housing 
for employees, if possible, to save them time 
traveling, etc (Barik et al., 2017). 

Kotze and Whitehead (2003) say that life 
balance is not "one single ultimate experience," 
but a series of individual experiences that hap-
pen over time and could be called "life balance 
moments." In the last analogy, a participant 
said that work-life balance for her is like a sea-
son that changes all the time. The above study 
backs up what the participants said, which 
means that the work-life balance of married fe-
male teachers during a pandemic will always 
be different and won't be the same for every-
one. Since it's like a cycle, married women learn 
to be good with their time, flexible, and crea-
tive. So, work-life balance isn't something 
you've done, it's just a part of life's seasons. 

 
Conclusion  

To create a more comprehensive statement, 
it is important to highlight some of the specific 
challenges faced by married career women and 

Metaphors of 
Work-Life Balance 

of Female 
Married Teachers 
During Pandemic

A drained 
cellphone

A melting 
candle

A big and 
strong tree

A COVID-19 
Vaccine

A season 
constantly 
changing

A spider
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working mothers during the pandemic. These 
challenges can include managing remote work 
responsibilities while also caring for children 
and elderly family members, dealing with job 
loss or reduced work hours, and struggling to 
maintain a healthy work-life balance while fac-
ing increased stress and anxiety. To address 
these challenges, it is crucial to implement pol-
icies and programs that support the needs of 
working mothers and married career women. 
For example, providing paid family leave and 
flexible work arrangements can help to reduce 
the burden of caregiving responsibilities and 
allow women to balance their work and per-
sonal lives more effectively. Additionally, in-
creasing access to affordable and high-quality 
childcare services can provide working moth-
ers with the support they need to continue 
working while ensuring their children receive 
adequate care. Moreover, organizations can 
promote gender equality by addressing pay 
disparities and promoting leadership opportu-
nities for women. Creating a supportive and in-
clusive work environment that values diversity 
can also help to attract and retain talented 
women. Thus, addressing the challenges faced 
by married career women and working moth-
ers during the pandemic requires a compre-
hensive approach that includes policies and 
programs designed to support their unique 
needs. By implementing these measures, it can 
help to create a more equitable and supportive 
work environment for women, ultimately ben-
efiting both individuals and society. 
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